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1. INTRODUCTION

1.1 Background

Faith communities in Tanzania, like in 
many other places in the world, have 
a longstanding history of engaging in 
the public space. Many faith-based 
organizations (FBOs) have established 
themselves as important actors in their 
local contexts in fields such as education 
and health. They have acquired credibil-
ity and respect as providers of social and 
development services and as advocates 
for global human values, such as peace 
and justice. Faith-based organizations 
often have a wide reach at community 
level, including the remotest areas where 
state institutions are few or even absent. 
It is unfortunate that only a small number 
of these activities are well documented 

and recognized nor are their contribu-
tions formally acknowledged.

Between June and November 
2019, the Waking the Giant (WtG) 
initiative in Tanzania conducted a 
mapping study of contributions by 
faith-based organizations (FBOs) to 
achieving five specific goals under the 
United Nations’ (UN) 2030 Agenda for 
Sustainable Development in Tanzania, 
namely Sustainable Development Goal 
(SDG): Good Health and Well-Being, 
SDG 4: Quality Education, SDG 5: 
Gender Equality, SDG 10: Reduced In-
equalities and SDG 16: Peace, Justice 
and Strong Institutions. The mapping 
activity aimed at gathering evidence of 
the ways in which FBOs contribute to 
these five goals, thereby establishing 

a baseline for future planning of FBOs’ 
engagement in those thematic areas.

1.2 Objectives 
of the study

The objectives of the mapping study 
were to:

1.	 create an initial evidence base of 
the contributions by Tanzanian 
faith-based organizations on the 
implementation of selected SDGs;

2.	provide evidence for further plan-
ning by faith-based organizations 
in the implementation of the 2030 
Agenda.
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2. METHODOLOGY

The mapping exercise used a mainly 
qualitative approach to data collection. 
This included visiting selected FBOs, 
including Churches, church-related 
development organizations, a Muslim 
organization, and social service institu-
tions owned by FBOs to conduct in-
depth key-informant interviews (KIIs) 
and focus group discussions (FGDs) 
with beneficiaries. It also included con-
ducting a document review of reports 
on relevant work done by FBOs.

The study covers the two main 
religions in Tanzania: Christianity and 
Islam. Key partners include mem-
bers of ACT Alliance Tanzania (ACT 
Forum): the Christian Council of 
Tanzania (CCT), the Evangelical Lu-
theran Church in Tanzania (ELCT), the 
Tanganyika Christian Refugee Service 
(TCRS), Norwegian Church Aid (NCA) 
and Act Church of Sweden (Act CoS). 
Moreover, two ACT Forum interfaith 
partners were included: Baraza Kuu la 
Kiislamu Tanzania (BAKWATA) and the 
Tanzania Episcopal Conference (TEC). 

To ensure consistency, efficiency 
and integrity, data collectors were 
recruited through the involved FBOs. 
They were either university graduates 
or postgraduates. Prior experience 
with data collection was seen as an 
advantage in the selection. Data col-
lectors were trained and oriented in 
the use of the data collection tools by 
a research expert and the National Co-
ordinator of Waking the Giant Tanzania. 
Head offices of all key partners were 
visited, and respondents were request-
ed to share relevant documents and 
reports for review. Officers responsible 
for projects and activities related to the 
five SDGs covered in the study were 
requested to participate in in-depth 
interviews. Key respondents who were 
interviewed include heads or directors 

of FBOs/dioceses/regions/institutions, 
health managers and monitoring and 
evaluation focal persons, educa-
tion officers, project officers, justice 
and peace focal persons, program 
coordinators, and beneficiaries. The 
beneficiaries who participated in FGDs 
included women and men at health in-
stitutions, students’ parents/guardians, 
and members of faith-based women’s 
and men’s groups. In addition, a 
selection of Christian dioceses and 
Muslim regions and institutions to be 
visited across the country was created 
jointly, resulting in a total coverage of 
13 regions (about 50%) of Tanzania 
Mainland.

Collectively, six targeted FBOs: 
BAKWATA, CCT, ELCT, NCA, TCRS 
TEC and one institution, the CSSC, 
were consulted. Six zones of the 
country with a total of 13 regions in 
Tanzania Mainland were reached. A 
total of 113 key informant interviews 
(KIIs) were conducted for the five 
SDGs (23, 25, 27, 17, and 21 respec-
tively). Furthermore, a total of 22 FGDs 
were conducted for SDGs 3, 4, and 5 
(9, 4, and 9 respectively). 

Two main tools were used for data 
collection: a KII guide which was 
administered to key informants and 
heads of programs at FBOs’ head of-
fices and selected dioceses/regions 
and institutions and a FGD guide 
which was used to guide focus group 
discussions with beneficiaries. The 
tools were first tested in Dar es Salaam 
to ensure that they were understand-
able and able to capture the intended 
information. The test experience was 
used to refine the tools which were 
then translated into Kiswahili for easy 
use. 

Data collectors’ competencies 
were approved before they were de-

ployed to the field and data collection 
was conducted under close supervi-
sion by the research expert and the 
WtG National Coordinator. The data 
collection team reviewed all collected 
data at the end of each field workday 
to ensure correctness, completeness, 
and relevance. All identifying informa-
tion (such as respondent names) was 
removed from the datasets. Quanti-
tative data were entered into SPSS, 
sorted and cleaned before analysis. In 
addition, all notes taken during focus 
group discussion and key informant 
interviews were entered in Kiswahili 
into password-protected computers 
and translated into English. Notes 
taken during interviews and discus-
sions were augmented by transcrip-
tions of audio records. All qualitative 
data were then transferred into Excel 
sheets for analysis. 

Team leaders and supervisors en-
sured data quality and assurance by 
supervising and participating in data 
collection, conducting spot-checking, 
and reviewing information entered in 
data collection tools for completeness 
and discrepancies. A joint session 
organized by the National Coordinator 
at the end of field work was used to 
convene all enumerators to examine 
their data for completeness, logic, 
and accuracy before collating it into a 
common data base. 

A two-day data analysis workshop 
was held with a data analysis group to 
review all the collected data with the 
aim of obtaining key and meaningful 
information for the exercise.

The mapping exercise adhered to 
standard research ethics including 
getting informed consent from each 
participant, ensuring confidentiality, 
and causing no harm to respondents. 
The mapping team made it clear to all 



6	 The Lutheran World Federation

participants that they were under no 
obligation to participate in the mapping. 
All participants were assured that there 
would be no negative consequences 
if they chose not to participate. Data 
collectors obtained informed written 
consent from all participants before 
commencing the interview or focus 
group discussion. Participants were 
assured anonymity and confidentiality.

2.1 Validation Workshop

After finalization of data collection and 
analysis, initial findings from the map-
ping exercise were verified through 
a “Stakeholder verification workshop” 
which was attended by representatives 
from all key FBOs. The aim was to 
get FBOs’ feedback on the mapping 
findings; to triangulate facts and iden-
tify any overstated or misrepresented 
information; to fill in gaps of missing 
information, and to propose initial rec-
ommendations based on the findings. 
The workshop aimed as well at getting 
an idea of the value and possible use of 
the gathered information for participat-

ing FBOs and at discussing how they 
might use or apply the information in 
their work. 

The validation workshop was also 
used to further examine existing efforts 
for interfaith collaboration in Tanzania 
in regard to what has worked well, 
what are the potential good practices 
and lessons learned, what have been 
the obstacles, and what can be done 
to improve interfaith collaboration in 
the country. The meeting explored the 
main challenges for FBOs’ contribution 
to achieving the SDGs as well as the 
experiences, challenges and dynamics 
of FBOs in working with the govern-
ment and in reporting their achieve-
ments to government data authorities.

2.2 Limitations

The mapping did not reach all FBOs, 
dioceses, regions and institutions in 
Tanzania, thereby limiting the breadth 
of data collected and findings reported 
through this mapping exercise. The 
activity was limited to the two main 
faiths in the country, i.e. Christian and 

Muslim. Ten of 30 BAKWATA regions, 
four of 12 CCT members, eight of 26 
ELCT dioceses, eight of 34 Catholic 
Dioceses, one of four TCRS project 
sites and one of five NCA project sites 
were covered. Together this is about 
3 percent of the sampling frame. Ap-
proximately 30 percent of Tanzania 
Mainland regions were visited due to 
the limited resources available for the 
mapping activity.

Quantitative data on specific SDG 
indicators and targets were not avail-
able at the time of data collection or 
simply never existed in some organi-
zations, as the majority of the visited 
FBOs do not report on SDG indicators 
and targets. Generally, the majority of 
FBOs had very weak or no relevant 
quantitative data to share. 

The mapping exercise was an 
internal review activity among FBOs 
and did not include government struc-
tures, authorities and statistics where 
relevant data could potentially have 
been obtained as well. 

Some prospective and or selected 
respondents were not available, de-
spite efforts to reach out in advance. 
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3. RESPONDENTS AND 
PARTICIPATING FBOs

This chapter presents an overview of 
demographic characteristics of the 
113 respondents. It moreover includes 
a brief description of the main FBOs 
that were reached with the mapping 
exercise.

3.1 Respondents’ 
Demographic 
Characteristics

Table 3.1 (a): Key informants interview 
respondents’ demographic character-
istics – see page 7.

Table 3.1 (b): Focus group discussion 
participants’ demographic character-
istics – see page 8.

3.2 Brief Overview 
of FBOs Reached 
for Mapping

Act Church of Sweden 
(Act CoS)

Act Church of Sweden (Act CoS) is 
an Evangelical Lutheran church with 
international work integrated fully into 
the Church’s life. International com-
mitment started with the formation of 
Church of Sweden Mission in 1874. 
International work focuses on respond-
ing to the global challenges of our time 
in collaboration with other Churches 
and with ecumenical organisations. 
Act CoS is influenced by the strategic 
orientations of the global alliances to 
which it belongs: Action by Churches 
Together (ACT Alliance), Lutheran 
World Federation (LWF) and World 
Council of Churches (WCC).

Act CoS works on humanitarian ac-
tion, development cooperation, church 
cooperation, and policy dialogue in 
four thematic policy areas: Gender 
Justice and Gender Equality; Sustain-
able Livelihoods; Peace and Recon-
ciliation; and Sexual and Reproductive 
Health and Rights (SRHR) in 16 coun-
try programs. The work is rights-based 
with the aim to strengthen local civil 
society. Together with partner organ-
isations, Act CoS strives to contribute 
to the development of just, peaceful 
and democratic societies in which 
human rights are respected and de-
fended. Act CoS is a recognised civil 
society actor with long experience in 
supporting local civil society organiza-
tions around the world. 

Within ACT Alliance, Act CoS is the 
leading agency for Community-based 
Psychosocial Support (CBPS). CBPS 

is a holistic approach to well-being, 
focusing not only on individual and 

“traditional” basic needs (e.g. shelter, 
non-food items, water, sanitation and 
hygiene) but also on beneficiary par-
ticipation, ability to influence humani-
tarian assistance, and the creation of 
community spaces for engagement. 
They also seek to make it possible for 
crisis-affected persons and communi-
ties to have an effect on efforts towards 
increased protection and well-being. 
In its development and humanitarian 
work, Act CoS takes advantage of 
the special opportunities and experi-
ence it has as a faith community by 
implementing and collaborating with 
partners through churches and or-
ganizations on a long-term basis. Act 
CoS prioritises both a rights-based 
approach and a Community-based 
Psycho-Social (CBPS) approach.

Table 3.1 (a)

Demographic Characteristics Males Females Total

Age Group

25 – 34 years 7 6 13

35 – 44 years 9 17 26

45 – 54 years 28 11 39

55 years and above 23 12 35

Total 67 46 113

Highest Education

Primary 3 1 4

Secondary 1 3 4

Vocational training 1 1 2

College/ university 63 40 103

Faith-Based Organization

BAKWATA 12 1 13

CCT 16 13 29

ELCT 21 14 35

TEC 18 8 26

Other 0 10 10



National Muslim Council 
of Tanzania (BAKWATA)

Baraza Kuu la Kiislamu Tanza-
nia (BAKWATA) was registered as a 
faith-based organization in 1968 to 
represent the interests of all Muslims 
in Tanzania Mainland. BAKWATA has 
offices in all 26 regions of Tanzania 
Mainland. The vision of the govern-
ing body of BAKWATA is to promote 
unity among Muslim communities on 

issues related to economic develop-
ment, education, health, women and 
development, peace and justice. Since 
its inception, BAKWATA has played a 
big role in supporting Tanzania’s social 
development initiatives by implement-
ing health, education, social and eco-
nomic programs. 

A number of programs have been 
implemented with a focus on capacity 
building and technical assistance to 

leaders at different levels, as well as 
on the establishment of specific health 
and social services such as for HIV and 
AIDS prevention education, advocacy 
against stigma, home-based care and 
support for orphans and vulnerable 
children and people living with HIV 
and AIDS, food and nutrition support, 
sexual and reproductive health and 
rights, life skills programs for youth and 
married couples, household economic 
strengthening support, gender equal-
ity/gender-based violence and legal aid, 
child labor, and mainstreaming HIV 
and AIDS in all programs and activities 
of the Council and mosques. 

Christian Council of 
Tanzania (CCT)

CCT is a Christian ecumenical 
organization founded in Tanzania in 
1964 that serves as an umbrella organ 
bringing together Protestant denomi-
nations and church-related institutions. 
Currently 13 denominations and 10 
church-related institutions are CCT 
members. The CCT vision is to be an 
ecumenical Christ-centered instru-
ment promoting sustainable, holistic 
development for the kingdom of God, 
whilst its mission is to foster unity in 
the body of Christ and coordinated 
engagement in addressing challenges 
and using the available opportunities 
to achieve sustainable, holistic devel-
opment in society.

Apart from its core evangelistic 
niche, CCT has provided diverse 
services to communities since its es-
tablishment including spiritual, social, 
economic and humanitarian services. 
As a faith-based umbrella organization, 
CCT members provide education ser-
vices, health services and economic 
empowerment to communities with 
a focus on womens’ development, 
children and gender, youth develop-
ment, health and HIV/AIDS; climate 
change, environment and food secu-
rity; social-economic justice and good 

Table 3.1 (b)

Demographic Characteristics Males Females Total

Age Group

15-24 years 3 35 38

25-34 years 7 42 49

35-44 years 5 18 23

45-54years 4 8 12

55 years and above 2 14 16

Missing 1 9 10

Total 22 128 148

Highest Education

No formal education 1 1 2

Primary 6 50 56

Secondary 8 42 50

Vocational training 6 23 29

College/ university 1 10 11

Marital Status

Single/ not married 6 36 42

Married 11 73 84

Cohabiting 1 7 8

Divorced/ separated 2 0 2

Other 1 1 2

Employment Status

Wage-employed 9 19 28

Self-employed/ entrepreneur 8 74 82

Not employed 3 13 16

Other 1 11 12

Location of Participant’s Residence

Rural 0 7 7

Peri-urban 16 95 111

Urban 5 15 20

Faith-Based Organization

BAKWATA 8 12 20

CCT 2 23 25

ELCT 5 30 35

TEC 7 61 68
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governance; policy analysis, interfaith 
relations and ecumenism.

CCT has an extensive Health 
and HIV/AIDS Program with diverse 
projects using different approaches 
to address special population groups 
including Most Vulnerable Children 
(MVC), Most at Risk Populations 
(MARPs), and People Living with 
HIV/AIDS (PLHA). Current programs 
include health and nutrition projects 
in Kondoa district, Chemba district, 
Kibondo and Kakonko district respec-
tively. CCT also collaborates with ACT 
CoS in preventing female genital mu-
tilation. In the area of economic em-
powerment programs, CCT provides 
financial assistance through Village 
Community Banks (VICOBA) worth 
three billion Tanzanian shillings from 
members’ savings.

Christian Social Services 
Commission (CSSC) 

The Christian Social Services Com-
mission (CSSC) is an ecumenical body 
jointly established by the Tanzania 
Episcopal Conference (TEC) and the 
Christian Council of Tanzania (CCT) 
in 1992 to coordinate social services 
provided by member churches. CSSC’s 
main objectives are to contribute to the 
physical, mental, social and spiritual 
development of the Tanzanian people 
by facilitating the provision of quality so-
cial services to all people, regardless of 
color, race, and creed; and to improve 
and expand education, health and 
other social services across the country.

The CSSC’s vision is “an enlight-
ened and well-educated community 
that is enjoying quality life and is free 
from diseases of poverty” and its 
mission is to “support the delivery of 
social services by church institutions 
in Tanzania through collaboration 
and partnership, advocacy, lobbying, 
capacity building and selected inter-
ventions, with the compassion and 
love of Christ”. 

CSSC’s main focus is on coordina-
tion of health and education services 
offered by faith-based actors in the 
country. 

Evangelical Lutheran Church 
in Tanzania (ELCT)

The Evangelical Lutheran Church 
in Tanzania (ELCT) is among the larg-
est and fastest-growing Churches in 
Tanzania. In June 19, 1963, seven 
Lutheran denominations merged 
under the umbrella of a federation to 
officially to become a single Church, 
known as the Evangelical Lutheran 
Church in Tanzania. ELCT has 26 dio-
ceses with over seven million church 
members spread throughout Tanzania 
and is registered as a voluntary and 
not-for-profit agency. The ELCT Vision 
is ‘a communion of people rejoicing 
in love and peace who are blessed 
spiritually and physically and hoping 
to inherit eternal life through Jesus 
Christ’. Its mission is to make people 
know Jesus Christ and have life in its 
fullness by bringing to them the “Good 
News” through word and deed based 
on the word of God as it is in the bible 
and Lutheran teachings, guided by its 
constitution. The ELCT head office is 
in Arusha, Tanzania but is divided into 
26 dioceses spread through all regions 
and districts of Tanzania.

ELCT’s core businesses is to 
evangelize, but the Church has long 
been known for providing social and 
development services in the country 
particularly in the fields of educa-
tion, health services, and economic 
empowerment of communities. The 
priorities are capacity building for 
mission and evangelism, income gen-
eration and stewardship, promotion of 
women’s work, gender relations and 
children’s rights, provision of qual-
ity social services, including educa-
tion and health services, and policy 
analysis and advocacy which targets 
local level and high-level policy issues. 

The services target diverse groups 
of beneficiaries including women, 
children, men, the elderly, adults and 
children with disabilities, victims of 
gender-based violence, marginalized 
groups, poor, incapacitated, and sick 
community members 

In the education sector, ELCT has 
two full-fledged universities and six 
constituent university colleges. It has 
over 67 registered secondary schools, 
15 English medium primary schools, 
nine special schools for children with 
disabilities, 40 Vocational Training 
Centers, and four teacher train-
ing colleges. In addition, ELCT has 
114 nursery schools. ELCT also has 
orphanage centers and centers for 
persons with disabilities. In the health 
services sector, ELCT owns a number 
of health facilities, including one na-
tional referral hospital, 24 hospitals, 
148 health centers and dispensaries 
which are estimated to contribute up 
to 15 percent of available health facili-
ties in Tanzania. ELCT also operates 
economic empowerment programs. 
Through its sustainable livelihoods and 
empowerment program. ELCT runs 
programs for raising dairy cattle and 
goats, (over 220 dairy cattle distrib-
uted); tree planting; biogas promotion, 
and establishment and strengthening 
of VICOBA groups. To realize these 
social services and economic em-
powerment programs, ELCT works 
very closely with the Government of 
Tanzania as a social service provider 
(health, education and social welfare). 
It also advocates for gender justice 
issues and for combating injustice in 
society.

Tanganyika Christian 
Refugee Services (TCRS) 

Tanganyika Christian Refugee Ser-
vices (TCRS) was established in 1964 
as an operational field program of the 
Lutheran World Federation’s Depart-
ment of World Service. During the first 
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20 years of operation, the organization 
was primarily involved in the devel-
opment of semi-permanent refugee 
settlements, mainly for Burundian, 
Rwandan, and Mozambican refugees 
in Tanzania. Following the aftermath 
of the ethnic conflict in Burundi 1993 
which drove more than half a million 
people out of Burundi and the Rwan-
dan genocide of 1994, TCRS’ work 
with refugees was concentrated in the 
Burundian refugee camps in Kibondo 
District, and in Karagwe District for 
the Rwandese refugees. The main 
activities were camp management, 
water and sanitation, environment, 
education, refugee self-reliance and 
logistics. More recently, TCRS has be-
come more active in refugee rights and 
advocacy as part of an overall com-
mitment to rights-based interventions.

Over the years, TCRS has con-
tributed its resources and capaci-
ties to marginalized, vulnerable and 
oppressed communities through 
construction of 66 primary schools 
in Monduli, Ngorongoro and Kiteto 
districts; construction of 25 primary 
schools in Lindi rural and Kilwa district; 
post-drought rehabilitation in Same, 
Simanjiro, Hai, Rombo and Arumeru 
districts through soil and water con-
servation and livelihood diversifica-
tion. Its work in refugee settlements 
has included infrastructure develop-
ment, camp management, education, 
community services and provision of 
logistics, psychosocial support and 
counselling, care and maintenance, 
extension services, donated commodi-
ties, and long-term development proj-
ects to refugee hosting communities. 

TCRS vision is empowered com-
munities living in a just, democratic 
society, united in diversity, and enjoy-
ing quality of life and God-given dignity. 

Its mission is to empower vulnerable, 
marginalized, and displaced communi-
ties to achieve self-reliance and sus-
tainable development and to reduce 
human suffering and poverty.

As a diaconal arm of the Evangeli-
cal Lutheran Church in Tanzania and 
the wider ecumenical network under 
CCT, TCRS recognises the spiritual and 
physical needs of its believers and en-
gages in different programs including 
food security, education, health, water, 
sanitation and hygiene, climate change 
adaptation and mitigation, peace and 
reconciliation, and gender justice. This 
concurs with TCRS’ objective of serv-
ing marginalized and disadvantaged 
communities in development and 
disaster relief projects. In fulfilling its 
mission, TCRS also reaches members 
of ELCT/ CCT who may be direct or 
indirect beneficiaries of projects.

Currently TCRS works in districts 
and locations with the highest vulner-
ability to disaster and the greatest 
concentration of poverty. It focuses 
on remote and vulnerable areas where 
adequate local capacities and services 
are not available. Current projects are 
in Ngara District, Dar es Salaam Urban 
Area (for urban refugees), Morogoro 
District, Kibondo District, Kakonko Dis-
trict, Kilwa District and Kishapu District.

Tanzania Episcopal 
Conference (TEC)

The Tanzania Episcopal Confer-
ence (TEC) is a permanent institution 
(the assembly of the Bishops of Tan-
zania) where, according to the norm of 
the church law, certain pastoral func-
tions are jointly exercised on behalf of 
Christ’s faithful in view of promoting 
that greater good which the Church 
offers to all people. TEC’s Vision is 

“To be a pastorally driven organ of the 
Catholic Bishops of Tanzania that lives 
catholic values and demands profes-
sional competence in its work”. Its 
mission is to be an instrument to guide, 
coordinate, facilitate and promote 
pastoral and social services through 
collaboration with people of good will, 
for the evangelization of all. 

TEC runs a number of programs 
through its departments for education, 
health, social welfare, publicity, legal 
affairs and insurance. TEC provides 
a number of education and health 
services in Tanzania in collaboration 
with other stakeholders to enhance the 
development and well-being of people.

Norwegian Church Aid (NCA) 
Norwegian Church Aid (NCA) is 

a Norwegian non-governmental and 
development organization working to 
promote social justice, human rights 
and economic justice for poor com-
munities. NCA has its foundations 
based in congregations in Norway 
whose efforts are dedicated towards 
eradicating poverty and its causes and 
social deprivation. 

In Tanzania, NCA works in col-
laboration with 12 local faith-based 
partners in 22 regions and 37 districts. 
NCA Tanzania implements two global 
programs: economic empowerment 
and resource governance; and two 
contextual programs: water, sanitation 
and hygiene and Haydom Lutheran 
Hospital. In addition, NCA focuses on 
cross-cutting issues to improve the 
quality of work. These include inter-
faith work to strengthen civil society 
and build social cohesion, gender 
justice, and youth engagement. NCA 
is planning to engage in a major gender 
justice project. 
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4. FBOs’ CONTRIBUTIONS IN 
ACHIEVING SDGs 3, 4, 5, 10, AND 16

1	  See WHO country information on Tanzania: https://www.afro.who.int/countries/united-republic-tanzania

Respondents were asked to explain 
what their FBO, diocese(s) and 
institution(s) are doing to contribute 
to achieving SDGs 3, 4, 5, 10 and 
16. They were further requested to 
elaborate what their FBO, dioceses 
and institutions are doing to contribute 
to specific targets under each SDG. 
This section presents a synthesis of 
their responses, integrating findings 
from review of project documents and 
reports, and from testimonies narrated 
by beneficiaries through focus group 
discussions. 

4.1 SDG 3 (Good 
Health and Well-being)

SDG 3 aims to “Ensure healthy lives 
and promote well-being for all at all 
ages”. The Tanzania Human Develop-
ment Report 2017 reports noticeable 
improvements in Tanzania in the 
area of health since the beginning of 
the century. Average life expectancy 
over the period from 2002 to 2012 
increased by almost nine years for 
men (from 51 years to 60 years) and 
by almost 13 years for women (from 
51 years to 64 years). Reductions in 
child mortality, a stabilization in HIV 
and AIDS levels, improved nutrition 

and hygiene, increased access to 
safe drinking water, and effective birth 
control and immunization have con-
tributed to this positive development. 
Nevertheless, important concerns re-
main in the field of health in Tanzania, 
including a continued threat through 
malaria and marked regional variances 
in relation to various health indicators. 

According to the WHO, health fi-
nancing is a central issue in Tanzania. 
The level of spending is still insufficient 
to ensure equitable access to basic and 
essential health services and interven-

tions. A major concern is thus to ensure 
adequate mobilization and equitable 
resource allocation for health.1

Faith-based actors contribute a 
major share of the basic healthcare 
system in the country. According to 
the Christian Social Services Commis-
sion (CSSC) in Tanzania, faith-based 
organizations are contributing up to 
40 percent of all hospital and primary 
healthcare services in Tanzania. CSSC 
coordinates all health services pro-
vided CCT and TEC all over the country. 
ELCT contributes 15 percent of health 
services in Tanzania.

Faith-based actors contribute 
a major share of the basic health 

care system in the country. CSSC’s 
health department coordinates and 
strengthens health services provided 
by Church health facilities falling under 
the Tanzanian Episcopal Conference 
(TEC) and the Christian Council of 
Tanzania (CCT). Currently, these facili-
ties total more than 900: 103 hospitals 
(two Zonal Referral Hospitals, 10 Re-
gional Referral Hospitals, 37 District/
Council Designated Hospitals, and 
54 Voluntary Agency Hospitals), 102 
health centers and 696 dispensaries.

In addition, Churches also offer 
pharmaceutical services and operate 
62 middle cadre health training insti-
tutions which provide certificates and 
diploma level professionals as well as 
two universities and three constituency 
colleges that provide health and medi-
cal education. Together, Churches own 
42 percent of all hospitals in Tanzania. 

All of the FBOs participating in 
the mapping report that they own 
and run health facilities and/or imple-
ment health programs that provide 
services to different population groups 
including women and children. These 
health facilities and programs provide 
important lifesaving services such 
as reproductive and child health 
(RCH) services, and prevention and 
treatment of communicable and non-
communicable diseases.

In addition, some FBOs operate 
universities and colleges that offer 
health and related sciences courses. 
For instance, ELCT and TEC have 
universities and a number of allied 
colleges that provide health-related 
courses from certificate to PhD level. 
Courses include medicine, nursing, 

SDG 3 
Ensure healthy lives 
and promote well-
being for all at all ages 
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clinical medicine, clinical pastoral 
education, public health and medical 
laboratory training. In addition, FBOs 
provide extensive medium-level pro-
fessional training. For example, the 
African Inland Church Tanzania (AICT) 
runs Kolandoto Health Training Col-
lege in Shinyanga region, ELCT has 
the Ilembula Hospital, TEC runs the 
Ndanda Hospital, and the Anglican 
Church has Mvumi Hospital. 

BAKWATA
BAKWATA operates health facilities 

across the country offering a number 
of essential health services. Most of 
its health services are found in the 
coastal area which has a higher share 
of Muslim communities. In Dar es Sa-
laam, Pwani and Tanga regions there 
is a concentration of lower-level health 
facilities run by BAKWATA. In addition, 
it also runs several facilities in other 
regions of Tanzania, most of them in 
cities and town centers with few in ru-
ral areas. In Singida region, BAKWATA 
provides health services at Gumanga 
Health Centre to all people regardless 
of their religion. Other regions include, 
Iringa, Tanga, Arusha, and Morogoro. 

An example of a health-related 
program implemented by BAKWATA 
is the USAID-funded “Kizazi Kipya” 
(in English: ‘New Generation’) project 
which serves thousands of orphans 
and vulnerable children with improved 
access to health and HIV services, 
among others. There is also a project 
under the Legal Service Facility which 
provides legal assistance to vulnerable 
population groups.

CCT
CCT contributes to ensuring healthy 

lives and promoting well-being for all at 
all ages through its member churches 
such as the African Inland Church 
of Tanzania (AICT) Anglican Church, 
Moravian Church, ELCT, and others. 

CCT owns and runs health facilities 
that provide quality health services to 
the general population. For example, 
AICT runs 16 health facilities in differ-
ent parts of the country. The Anglican 
Church also operates a number of hos-
pitals and lower-level health facilities. 
Other member churches also have 
health facilities, most of them in rural 
and hard-to-reach parts of the coun-
try. As well, CCT provides community 
health services through community 
health workers. CCT Mbeya uses 
community health workers to reach 
communities with health services 
including health education.

CSSC
CSSC coordinates health services 

provided by church members all over 
the country. 

ELCT
ELCT is among the major providers 

of health services in the country. It 
offers quality health services for all at 
all ages. ELCT runs 24 hospitals and 
148 lower-level health facilities (health 
centers and dispensaries) all over the 
country. Most of these health facilities 
are located in rural areas. For example, 
ELCT Mwanza, through its health facili-
ties, provides health services such as 
reproductive and child health, outpa-
tient departments (OPDs), and surgery. 
Furthermore, ELCT operates one of key 
national referral hospitals, the Kiliman-
jaro Christian Medical Centre (KCMC) 
which is owned by the Good Samaritan 
coalition that also serves as a teach-
ing medical university. The other 
hospitals include five regional referral 
and six designated district Hospitals 
(DDH) and seven council-designated 
hospitals. Altogether, ELCT provides 
about 15 percent of all hospital-based 
services in the country. Apart from 
running health facilities, ELCT imple-
ments community-based programs to 

improve community health through 
health education.

ELCT is among the major provid-
ers of health services in the country. 
It offers quality health services for all 
at all ages. ELCT runs 24 hospitals, 
148 health centers and dispensaries 
throughout the country. Most of 
these health facilities are located in 
rural areas. ELCT operates one of the 
key national referral hospitals, the 
Kilimanjaro Christian Medical Centre 
(KCMC) which is owned by the Good 
Samaritan coalition. The KCMC also 
serves as a teaching medical univer-
sity. In addition, ELCT has five regional 
referral hospitals, six District Desig-
nated hospitals and seven Council 
Designated hospitals. Altogether, ELCT 
provides approximately 15 percent 
of all hospital-based services in the 
country. Furthermore, ELCT through 
its rural and urban health facilities 
provides health services such as RCH, 
treatment of communicable and non-
communicable diseases, and surgery. 
Apart from running health facilities, 
ELCT implements community-based 
programs to improve community 
health through health education.

ELCT respondents underline that 
some of their health facilities have an 
outstanding reputation for the quality 
of services provided. For instance, a 
health facility of ELCT in Shinyanga 
region provides dental services and 
attracts people from distances as far 
as 50-100 kilometers. ELCT Mwanza 
region is proud of the RCH services 
offered by its Nyakato health center 
in which not a single case of maternal 
death has occurred since its establish-
ment in 2006.

TEC
Another major provider of health 

services in Tanzania is the TEC. Like 
other FBOs, TEC owns and runs health 
facilities across the country, offering 
quality health services to different 
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population groups, including women 
and children. Among faith-based ac-
tors in Tanzania, TEC owns the highest 
number of health facilities. It runs a 
national referral hospital, the Bugando 
Christian Medical Centre, five regional 
referral hospitals, 12 designated dis-
trict hospitals (DDHs) and a number 
of health centers and dispensaries 
distributed all over Tanzania. Most of 
the lower-level facilities are located in 
rural areas and run by nuns. In addi-
tion, TEC owns a medical university 
and several medical/health colleges 
attached to its health facilities. TEC 
health facilities offer outreach services 
to public and primary schools to cre-
ate awareness of public health issues 
in the communities and to vaccinate 
children. TEC health facilities also pro-
vide maternal and childcare services. 
Most health services are provided on 
a fee-for-service basis. All fees are 
subsidized to enhance their accessibil-
ity for communities. This implies that 
operating the facilities is expensive for 
TEC. A respondent from one TEC facil-
ity in Shinyanga reported that although 
they were not getting any grants, they 
had been running a health centre for 
more than ten years without interrup-
tion. This included paying monthly 
salaries on time, purchasing essential 
medicines, and running other facility 
activities.

TCRS
TCRS works in collaboration with dis-

tricts and village authorities to coordinate 
health programs. TCRS provides health 
education – such as on clean and safe 
water – with a special focus on reach-
ing communities of the most vulnerable, 
marginalized and displaced populations.

SDG 3 Targets
The following table provides an 

overview of the evidence that this study 
has been able to gather in relation to 
the surveyed FBOs’ involvement with 
specific targets under SDG 3. It is not 
meant to provide comprehensive infor-
mation on all the activities that these 
FBOs are implementing.

TARGET 3.1: By 
2030, reduce the 
global maternal 
mortality ratio to 
less than 70 per 
100,000 live births

All surveyed FBOs own and run health 
facilities in several regions of the 
country through which they provide 
services to pregnant women, includ-
ing antenatal care, labor and delivery, 
postnatal care and services to lactating 
women. They also organize advocacy 
actions to improve maternal health and 
promote awareness on the subject.

ELCT and TEC in particular are 
major stakeholders in improving ma-
ternal health and reducing maternal 
mortality. The work of FBOs in reduc-
ing maternal mortality rate ranges from 
the direct provision of related services 
throughout the country to program-
matic community-based work focused 
on behavioral changes. The status, 
capacity and quality of FBO facilities 
in the field of maternal health is recog-
nized by the government. For instance, 
Cardinal Rugambwa Hospital (a TEC-
owned hospital in Dar es Salaam) 
receives government subsidies that 
provide incentives and staff salaries for 
supporting maternal and child health 
services. As well, TEC provides train-
ing and seminars for service providers 
to increase skills and competency in 
attending pregnant women.

“Our healthcare providers receive dif-

ferent trainings to ensure all women 

and children are offered the right 

health services.” (TEC Iringa).

Faith-based organizations make sig-
nificant contributions to increasing the 
proportion of births attended by skilled 
health personnel, thereby playing a 
crucial role in preventing and reducing 
maternal and child mortality in Tanza-
nia. They provide pre-service training 
for maternal healthcare providers such 

Target

FBO

BAKWATA 

CCT

ELCT

TCRS

TEC
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as doctors, nurses, and midwives. They 
employ, and provide salary subsidies 
to, maternal healthcare providers, in-
cluding doctors, nurses and midwives. 
For instance, CCT provides training to 
maternal healthcare personnel at some 
of its colleges, which provide both pre- 
and in-service training. 

“We have our health colleges that pro-

vide different courses such as diplo-

mas in nursing, clinical medicine and 

laboratory. These facilities provide 

and strengthen the skills our service 

provides in different areas such as 

birth attendance.” (Director of Health 

Department at AICT Mwanza)

ELCT trains health workers at its own 
training centers and colleges as well 
as through internal capacity building 
in its health facilities. Moreover, ELCT 
uses training organized by government 
and other health actors to enhance 
the skills of their health workers in 
maternal care and birth attendance. 

‘‘Our health service providers have 

been participating in different train-

ings undertaken by the government 

or non-government organizations but 

also we have been imparting skills 

among ourselves just to remind and 

strengthen the provision of better birth 

attendance services.” (ELCT Nyakato 

Health Centre in Mwanza region) 

TEC health facilities provide training of 
midwives and birth attendants mostly 
from its own training facilities attached 
to several hospitals in the country. 
It also gets additional skilled staff 
through secondment from the govern-
ment as well as employing skilled staff 
from other colleges and institutions 

“We provide employment to maternal 

healthcare providers, also the gov-

ernment provides us with experts.” 

(Respondent at TEC Facility – Iringa 

region)

TARGET 3.2: By 
2030, end pre-
ventable deaths 
of newborns and 
children under 5 
years of age, with 
all countries aiming 
to reduce neona-
tal mortality to 
at least as low as 
12 per 1,000 live 
births and under-5 
mortality to at least 
as low as 25 per 
1,000 live births

FBOs are particularly active across the 
country to improve newborn and child 
health and reduce mortality of newborns 
and children under five years of age. 
FBOs implement child and newborn 
health programs in almost all regions in 
Tanzania, including facility-based child 
health services; outreach child health 
services, such as immunization services; 
and newborn care services.

Child health services form part of 
the standard package of health services 
provided by FBOs and several of their 
health facilities have special units or 
departments for maternal, newborn and 
child health services, often with a good 
reputation regarding the quality of their 
services. Where specialized services 
cannot be provided, FBOs refer patients 
to the appropriate health institutions, as 
reported by BAKWATA. Several FBOs, 
including CCT and ELCT report that 
they run community-based programs on 
topics related to child health, e.g. in the 
area of infant nutrition. Outreach activi-
ties also include immunization services 
to children. In many cases, child health 
services are provided at a highly subsi-
dized rate or free of charge.

“We have an RCH unit which attends 

children and we are doing our best 

to ensure no child or newborn dies 

at our health facility. The depart-

ment has experienced and qualified 

healthcare providers and up to now 

the facility has good reputation in 

serving children and mothers.” (ELCT 

Nyakato Health Centre, Mwanza)

“All health facilities owned by ELCT 

provide immunization, outreach, 

and pediatric care services for all 

children to get treatment services”. 

(Respondent at ELCT Arusha Region)

“We have RCH services that help 

women and children. We have equip-

ment that supports child breathing 

since it is very important to help 

child breathing. Not only that but 

also we have established a referral 

system. Once we face any complica-

tions that are out of our control, we 

provide referral to nearby hospitals.” 

(TEC Health Center, Shinyanga)

“Newborn babies and their mothers 

receive free healthcare services at 

our health facilities.” (TEC Respon-

dent, Iringa)

TARGET 3.3: By 
2030, end the 
epidemics of AIDS, 
tuberculosis, ma-
laria and neglected 
tropical diseases 
and combat hepa-
titis, water-borne 
diseases and other 
communicable 
diseases.

When it comes to ending epidemics, 
neglected tropical diseases and other 
communicable diseases, FBOs are 
among the key actors in Tanzania. 
Their activities can broadly be catego-
rized into regular services provided 
through the health facilities owned by 
FBOs, specific (donor-funded) health 
programs, and activities in the field of 
awareness raising aimed at encourag-
ing behavioral changes. All visited FBOs 
report that they are supporting or pro-
viding prevention, care, treatment, sup-
port, and referral and linkage services 
for HIV and AIDS, tuberculosis, malaria, 
neglected tropical diseases, hepatitis 
(including provision of hepatitis vac-
cine), water-borne diseases, and other 
communicable diseases. They also 
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raise awareness about healthy lifestyles 
through sharing information, teach-
ing, and preaching. FBOs encourage 
healthy behaviors such as sleeping un-
der long-lasting insecticide treated nets 
(LLITN), washing hands before eating 
and after using the toilet, and drinking 
safe and clean water. They promote two 
components of safer sex: abstinence 
and fidelity. FBOs also organize and 
support advocacy actions to improve 
public health policies and practices at 
the local and national levels. 

BAKWATA, CCT, TCRS, ELCT and 
TEC are all major actors in combating 
HIV and AIDS. Their services include 
HIV testing, prevention, care and treat-
ment, including a focus on preventing 
mother-to-child transmission. Tuber-
culosis and malaria also form part of 
the communicable diseases that are 
treated as part of the standard ser-
vices provided by faith-based health 
facilities. Only some FBOs focus on 
addressing hepatitis. TCRS has a spe-
cific focus on providing safe and clean 
drinking water and preventing water-
borne diseases. FBOs refer patients to 
government hospitals whenever their 
health facilities are not able to provide 
the needed care and treatment. 

“We provide treatment for different 

diseases though not all diseases. For 

example, we test people for HIV but 

treatment for HIV positive is provided 

by other facilities as we don’t have a 

care and treatment clinic. Further-

more, we don’t deal with TB since our 

facility does not have diagnostic tests 

for TB.” (A respondent at one ELCT 

health facility in Shinyanga region)

TARGET 3.4: By 
2030, reduce by 
one third prema-
ture mortality from 
non-communicable 
diseases through 
prevention and 
treatment and pro-
mote mental health 
and well-being.

Through their health facilities all over 
the country, FBOs are involved in the 
prevention and treatment of non-com-
municable diseases. Most lower-level 
facilities focus on prevention of such 
diseases and only provide treatment of 
early symptoms due to their limitations 
in capacity for specialized treatment. 
The provision of information on preven-
tion and treatment of cardiovascular 
diseases, cancer or diabetes forms 
part of the services widely provided 
by FBO-owned health facilities. BAK-
WATA, CCT, ELCT and TEC are among 
the FBOs reporting activities in this 
area. ELCT and TEC have a particularly 
wide geographical reach and provide 
specialized services in some of their 
health facilities.

Moreover, FBOs provide pastoral 
care, spiritual support and counsel-
ling to people living in despair and 
hopelessness. Some of these offer 
specialized secondary and tertiary 
level mental health services.

TARGET 3.5: 
Strengthen the pre-
vention and treat-
ment of substance 
abuse, including 
narcotic drug abuse 
and harmful use of 
alcohol.

Despite the fact that substance abuse is 
an important health concern in Tanzania, 
most FBOs interviewed indicate that 
they have insignificant or no interven-
tions to address the issue. Among the 
few FBOs that address substance abuse 
is TEC in Dar es Salaam and the Coastal 
region which has related activities within 
the implementation of a donor-funded 
community-based project on HIV. The 
ELCT, in the Northern zone, reports 
having specific hospitals that provide 
services for drug and substance abuse 
as well as for mental health. These are 
the Kilimanjaro Christian Medical Centre 
(KCMC), Haydom Lutheran Hospital, 
and Lutindi Mental Hospital. 

TARGET 3.7: By 
2030, ensure 
universal access to 
sexual and repro-
ductive health-care 
services, including 
for family planning, 
information and 
education, and the 
integration of repro-
ductive health into 
national strategies 
and programs.

Most of the interviewed FBOs support 
the Tanzanian government in enhanc-
ing access to sexual and reproductive 
healthcare services for women, men, 
and youth. However, FBOs differ in 
their approaches to the topic and in 
the nature of interventions under-
taken. These differences are based 
on religious belief and convictions and 
concern particularly the question of 
modern family planning. For instance, 
as the use of modern contraceptive 
measures is against the Catholic faith, 
TEC institutions do not provide any 
services in that respect. However, TEC 
institutions provide natural family plan-
ning services. BAKWATA, CCT, ELCT 
and TEC all report that they provide 
sexual and reproductive healthcare 
services in their health facilities. TCRS 
offers awareness training on sexual 
and reproductive health to youth in 
schools as well as to Inter-Religious 
Village Community Banks (IR-VICOBA) 
members during their sessions. Some 
of the interviewed FBOs underline that 
these services are provided free-of-
charge as directed by the Tanzanian 
Ministry of Health. 

TARGET 3.8: 
Achieve universal 
health coverage, 
including financial 
risk protection, 
access to quality 
essential health-
care services and 
access to safe, ef-
fective, quality and 
affordable essential 
medicines and vac-
cines for all.
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All FBOs which run health facilities 
have incorporated health insurance 
services that help all members to 
have access to health services when 
needed. FBOs report that they have 
strengthened their services over the 
years with a view to accepting differ-
ent kinds of insurance in their health 
facilities. Additionally, some of the 
interviewed FBOs indicated that they 
encourage people to get enrolled in 
health insurance schemes. There are 
also FBOs that have no health facilities 
but which support or pay insurance 
for people. For instance, CCT through 
the Anglican Church in Shinyanga 
implements a project funded by Com-
passion International which provides 
health insurance coverage for children. 

FBOs provide education and 
awareness to the communities they 
serve, thereby encouraging the utiliza-
tion of available health services in order 
to improve community health. 

TARGET 3.B: Sup-
port the research 
and development 
of vaccines and 
medicines for the 
communicable and 
non-communicable 
diseases that 
primarily affect de-
veloping countries, 
provide access to 
affordable es-
sential medicines 
and vaccines, in 
accordance with 
the Doha Declara-
tion on the TRIPS 
Agreement and 
Public Health, 
which affirms the 
right of develop-
ing countries to 
use to the full 
the provisions in 
the Agreement 
on Trade-Related 
Aspects of Intel-
lectual Property 
Rights regarding 
flexibilities to pro-
tect public health, 
and, in particular, 
provide access to 
medicines for all.

FBOs do little, if anything, to support 
research and development of vaccines 
and medicines for communicable 
and non-communicable diseases in 
Tanzania. However, they are very ac-
tive in ensuring access to affordable 
essential medicines and vaccines, 
mostly through direct provision of 
vaccines in their health facilities and 
their participation in national vaccina-
tion campaigns. ELCT Arusha reports 
they are currently involved in medical 
research which does not however 
involve vaccine development.

FBOs own three main research 
hospitals in the country: KCMC in 
Moshi (owned by ELCT), and Ifakara 
Hospital in Ifakara and Bugando Hos-
pital in Mwanza (both owned by TEC). 
Other upcoming faith-based research 
hospitals include Haydom Hospital in 
Manyara, Peramiho, Hospital in Ru-
vuma, and Mvumi Hospital in Dodoma.

TARGET 3.C: Sub-
stantially increase 
health financing 
and the recruitment, 
development, train-
ing and retention of 
the health work-
force in developing 
countries, especially 
in least developed 
countries and small 
island developing 
States.

Several FBOs support and run colleges 
which provide pre-service training 
for healthcare workers. The training 
provided covers both standard medi-
cal services as well as para-medical 
education. An example of the latter 
is the Clinical Pastoral Education pro-
gram of the KCMC through which ELCT 
provides training annually to about 50 
pastors from various confessions from 
all over Tanzania on counselling and 
spiritual support to chronically sick 
people or people living in despair. 

“We have two health colleges which 

train a large number of healthcare 

workers who are employed in differ-

ent health facilities in the country”. 

(AICT Mwanza)

SDG 3 Implementation 
Challenges 

Focus group discussions were con-
ducted in order to obtain detailed 
information on challenges that FBOs 
face in implementing interventions 
and activities contributing to meeting 
SDG 3. The challenges identified can 
be grouped into the following areas of 
concern: policy and legal framework; 
shortage of funds and of human 
resources; and conflicting priorities 
within FBO health facilities. 

Policy and legal framework
Policy and legal challenges are 

twofold. On the one hand there are 
good policies which, however, do not 
work in practice. A respondent at ELCT 
Mwanza region reports concerns with 
the Public Private Partnership (PPP) 
initiative, which, according to that re-
spondent, has potential for improving 
health services but is dysfunctional. 
Initially, the PPP initiative was meant 
to pull together resources from both 
private and public sectors for improv-
ing health services in FBO facilities. 
Unfortunately, the state has not lived 
up to the expectations as it has failed 
to provide the necessary, and agreed, 
inputs to faith-based facilities. 

Some policies and legal frame-
works are not friendly for FBOs’ opera-
tions. A respondent at TEC Shinyanga 
region shares concerns that the cur-
rent policy on exemptions has no bud-
get and that therefore the government 
does not reimburse costs incurred 
by pregnant mothers, children under 
the age of five, and the elderly. The 
respondent further suggests that the 
government should provide grants to 
cover the costs for exempted popula-
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tion groups such as elderly people, 
people with disabilities, and patients 
with chronic conditions.

Funding for health services
Almost all FBOs declare that short-

age of funds is a major challenge for 
their effective contribution toward the 
realization of SDG 3. The lack of suf-
ficient funds hinders the operation of 
FBOs in different areas, particularly 
in the recruitment and retention of 
a healthcare workforce (specialists), 
procurement of medical equipment 
and medicines, and construction of 
infrastructure that facilitates easy op-
eration of medical procedures.

Due to the general shortage of hu-
man resources for health in Tanzania, 
FBOs likewise face a great challenge 
in recruiting and retaining professional 
health workers in their facilities. Almost 
all FBO respondents indicate that 
there is shortage of medical special-
ists, nursing staff as well as laboratory 
and imaging specialists as they tend to 
move to government-owned facilities. 
In this regard, the government is the 
biggest challenger when it comes to 
staffing.

Conflicting priorities within 
FBO health facilities

Underlying internal conflicts within 
FBOs have significant negative im-
pacts. This happens mostly between 
the leaders of an FBO on the one hand, 
who may understand health facilities 
as sources of organizational income, 
and the health facility leaders on the 
other hand, who report that funds col-
lected from patients’ fees are insuffi-
cient to cover actual costs. Most FBOs 
are financed by user fees which have 
never been enough to meet hospital 
operating expenditures.

FBOs do take measures to over-
come the above-mentioned challenges, 
depending on the specific situation. 

Respondents gave the following exam-
ples of how they deal with challenges 
within their institutions:

“In response to the challenges, we do 

everything we can to explore differ-

ent sources of funding including find-

ing donors to support our initiatives. 

But also on issues concerning poli-

cies and legal framework, we have 

been discussing with the government 

through CSSC.” (TEC Dar es Salaam 

and Coastal region)

“Due to lack of grants from the 

government, we have now started 

to review the prices for services that 

ought to be free so that clients can 

share the cost and can reflect the 

real situation. Furthermore, due to in-

sufficient funds, particularly on pay-

ing the workforce, we have started 

to downsize human resources as 

salaries take almost 60 percent of 

our budget, something that we can’t 

afford.” (ELCT Mwanza)

4.2 SDG 4 (Quality 
Education)

SDG 4 aims to “ensure provision of 
quality and equitable education for 
all” including the ambition to offer all 
children free, equitable, and quality 
primary and secondary education by 
2030. The goal is in line with Tanza-
nia’s human rights obligations to realize 
the right to primary and secondary 
education for all. The Tanzania Human 
Development Report 2017 reports no-

ticeable improvements in education in 
Tanzania particularly regarding primary 
and secondary school enrolments. 

Faith-based actors have for long 
time been major contributors to the 
basic education system in the country. 
The majority of FBOs’ schools provide 
heavily subsidized school fees and also 
sponsor a significant number of poor 
and marginalized children.

According to CSSC, education 
facilities owned and managed by 
the current TEC and CCT member 
churches include:

•	 370 registered pre-primary schools
•	 172 primary schools
•	 370 secondary schools (including 

52 seminaries)
•	 12 teachers colleges
•	 126 vocational education and train-

ing centers
•	 26 universities and university colleges

These facilities are spread throughout 
the country, and many are rural based. 

In total, Churches own about seven 
percent of all basic education facilities 
in the country. 

In Tanzania, until recently, many 
families did not enroll their children in 
school because they could not afford 
school fees and related expenses. But 
the government has now taken a cru-
cial step by abolishing all public school 
fees and “contributions”, i.e. additional 
fees charged by schools to pay for 
the schools’ running costs which 
were previously required to support 

SDG 4  
Ensure inclusive 
and equitable 
quality education 
and promote 
lifelong learning 
opportunities for all
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schools in the country. Both primary 
and secondary school enrollment has 
significantly increased as a result. The 
abolition of school fees has been one 
of the most important actions taken 
by the government to implement its 
ambitious education goals. 

Respondents were asked to ex-
plain what their FBO, diocese(s) and 
institution(s) are doing to ensure 
inclusive and equitable quality educa-
tion and to promote lifelong learning 
opportunities for all.

FBOs are working towards achiev-
ing quality education in Tanzania 
through ensuring inclusive and eq-
uitable quality education and pro-
moting lifelong learning for all. All 
interviewed FBOs indicate that they 
run education centers ranging from 
pre-school to college and university 
level. They highlight that particularly 
their secondary schools produce good 
academic performance as compared 
to public schools. Furthermore, all 
the responding FBOs report that they 
provide support to students from poor 
families which cannot afford to pay the 
required school fees. 

2	 International schools enroll students from all over the world and the medium of communication is English while local schools are 

only for Tanzanians and communication is in both English and Kiswahili.

BAKWATA
BAKWATA supports children who 

cannot afford education expenses, 
enabling them to also get an education. 
For instance, BAKWATA in Arusha 
region identifies the needy in order 
to give them education opportunities 
through their schools. BAKWATA en-
rolls students regardless of gender or 
socio-demographic status.

CCT
Similar to other FBOs, CCT is a very 

important actor in promoting inclusive 
and equitable quality education as well 
as lifelong learning opportunities for all. 
CCT’s activities in education include 
running schools that enroll students 
without any discrimination as well as 
the mobilization of communities to get 
access to education through existing 
education facilities. CCT members 
throughout the country own schools at 
all levels from kindergarten to univer-
sity, including local and international2 
schools. One of the schools visited 
during this mapping is Isamilo Inter-
national School in Mwanza which is 
owned and managed by the Anglican 
Church in Mwanza. 

ELCT
ELCT runs many schools across 

the country, accommodating students 
of different socio-demographic status. 
Thousands of students have graduated 
from ELCT education facilities includ-
ing secondary schools, colleges and 
universities. Furthermore, ELCT sup-
ports and sponsors students facing 
difficult financial conditions thereby 
helping them to access quality edu-
cation. 

TEC
TEC operates many schools at 

different levels from kindergarten to 
university level. TEC reports that their 
schools enroll any person requiring 
education, regardless of religion, sex, 
ethnicity, or economic status. A ma-
jority of the country’s political leaders 
and senior civil servants graduated 
from TEC schools. Additionally, TEC 
supports large numbers of students 
who cannot afford to complete their 
studies due to school fees. 

TCRS
TCRS contributes in three different 

ways to ensuring inclusive and equi-

Target

FBO

BAKWATA

CCT

ELCT

TCRS

TEC
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table quality education and promoting 
lifelong learning opportunities for all. 
First, TCRS sponsors or funds the 
building of classrooms in Tanzania. 
Secondly, TCRS conducts campaigns 
to mobilize and sensitize people to get 
an education and, thirdly, TCRS con-
ducts literacy and numeracy classes 
for adults. The classes are open to 
interested participants, regardless of 
gender or age.

TARGET 4.1: By 
2030, ensure that 
all girls and boys 
complete free, eq-
uitable and quality 
primary and sec-
ondary education 
leading to relevant 
and effective learn-
ing outcomes.

BAKWATA, CCT, ELCT and TEC all 
operate primary and secondary edu-
cation facilities, providing education 
to both boys and girls. Several of the 
responding FBOs underlined their 
commitment to providing high-quality 
education services and to an inclusive 
approach to education for all. In order 
to reach students of various social 
and economic status, FBOs provide 
financial support to students from 
disadvantaged families. 

TARGET 4.2: By 
2030, ensure that 
all girls and boys 
have access to qual-
ity early childhood 
development, care 
and pre-primary 
education so that 
they are ready for 
primary education.

Almost all of the interviewed FBOs 
provide forms of early childcare and 
pre-primary education. The services 
are often religious in nature, with 
some secular curricula. This includes 
the operation of Sunday schools or 
Madrassas providing detailed Christian 
or Muslim education to children of pre-

primary school age to motivate them 
about their traditional religions.

TARGET 4.4: By 
2030, substantially 
increase the number 
of youth and adults 
who have relevant 
skills, including 
technical and 
vocational skills, for 
employment, decent 
jobs and entrepre-
neurship.

FBOs make substantial contribu-
tions to ensure that youth and adults 
have relevant skills for employment, 
decent jobs and entrepreneurship. 
Interviewed FBOs report engaging 
in particular in the following three 
areas: provision of entrepreneurship 
education in the community and in 
churches and mosques; supporting 
youth and adults in getting access to 
technical and vocational skills by pro-
viding sponsorship or waiving school 
fees for those who cannot afford to 
pay; and running centers or colleges 
that provide technical and vocational 
education or skills-based education.

“We have been conducting entre-

preneurship seminars here to our 

church members especially women 

and youths to help them start their 

own business to get income.” (ELCT 

Shinyanga region)

“Here in our vocational centre, we 

provide education and handcraft 

skills that prepare youth for creating 

their own jobs and to be self-reliant.” 

(BAKWATA Arusha region)

“We have vocational training colleges 

that enrol and produce many skilled 

youths all over the country.” (TEC 

Dar es Salaam region)

TARGET 4.5: By 
2030, eliminate 
gender dispari-
ties in education 
and ensure equal 
access to all levels 
of education and 
vocational training 
for the vulnerable, 
including persons 
with disabilities, 
indigenous peoples 
and children in vul-
nerable situations.

Within their educational activities, 
FBOs put an emphasis on address-
ing gender disparities and promoting 
equal access to education for all 
children. This includes providing ac-
cess to education within their own 
education institutions without any 
kind of discrimination as well as sup-
porting vulnerable population groups 
through financial sponsorship pro-
grams. Several FBOs engage actively 
in advocacy and community-based 
awareness raising to promote equal 
access to education for girls and boys. 
Some FBOs report that they pay spe-
cific attention to students with special 
needs, including those with disabilities, 
by adapting the school environment 
and infrastructure accordingly. One 
example is to ensure easy access to 
classrooms and sanitation facilities for 
children with physical disabilities.

TARGET 4.6: By 
2030, ensure that 
all youth and a 
substantial propor-
tion of adults, both 
men and women, 
achieve literacy and 
numeracy.

Generally, this target is presently less 
in the focus of FBOs. This mapping 
exercise did not find any significant 
initiatives by FBOs that target achiev-
ing literacy and numeracy for youth 
and adults apart from enrolling youth 
in normal formal education in FBOs’ 
schools. However, a respondent at 
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TEC in Mbeya region reports that TEC 
does conduct additional literacy and 
numeracy classes through vocational 
training colleges for youth and adults 
who did not have an opportunity to get 
that training when they were children. 
An example is a TEC-owned vocational 
school called TOMASMOR, which 
encourages enrolment and participa-
tion of all people regardless of their 
literacy level.

TARGET 4.A: Build 
and upgrade educa-
tion facilities that 
are child, disability 
and gender sensi-
tive and provide 
safe, non-violent, 
inclusive and effec-
tive learning envi-
ronments for all.

Most of the interviewed FBOs focus on 
the creation of friendly environments 
that favor safe, non-violent, inclusive 
and effective learning environments for 
all. All FBOs that operate education fa-
cilities assert that they focus on build-
ing infrastructures that are friendly 
to, and can be used by, everyone, 
including people with disabilities. This 
includes building ramps for people 
with physical disabilities. Some FBOs 
report that they mobilize parents and 
guardians in contributing to a school 
infrastructure and environment that is 
friendly to all people. 

With regard to gender sensitivity, 
the majority of FBOs which run board-
ing schools focus on building special 
dormitories for girls considering their 
vulnerability for early pregnancies 
and engaging in early sexual activities 
when they have to stay elsewhere than 
in school compounds.

TARGET 4.B: By 
2020, substantially 
expand globally the 
number of scholar-
ships available to 
developing coun-
tries, in particular 
least developed 
countries, small 
island developing 
States and Afri-
can countries, for 
enrolment in higher 
education, includ-
ing vocational train-
ing and information 
and communica-
tions technology, 
technical, engineer-
ing and scien-
tific programmes, in 
developed countries 
and other develop-
ing countries.

FBOs are very committed to contrib-
uting to this target. The majority of 
FBOs make scholarships available to 
Tanzanians principally through two ap-
proaches: using internal FBO budgets 
for the direct provision of scholarships 
to those who perform well but also to 
those who cannot afford to pay fees; 
and reaching out to external donors 
who provide scholarships to Tanzani-
ans through the FBOs. This strategy 
has contributed much in ensuring 
FBOs retain some well-trained profes-
sionals to work in schools owned by 
the organization or partners.

TARGET 4.C: By 
2030, substan-
tially increase the 
supply of qualified 
teachers, including 
through interna-
tional cooperation 
for teacher training 
in developing coun-
tries, especially 
least developed 
countries and small 
island developing 
States.

This mapping activity finds that FBOs 
have three main initiatives that help to 
increase the supply of qualified teach-
ers and instructors to serve within their 

facilities: employing qualified teachers 
to support FBOs’ facilities for good 
results; providing incentives such as 
attractive salaries and other benefits 
including housing, loans, transporta-
tion and scholarships; and training 
teachers and covering costs of training 
for in-service teachers to increase their 
skills and academic qualifications. In 
most cases, external development 
partners have supported FBOs by 
providing focused sponsorships for 
training.

SDG 4 Implementation 
Challenges 

The interviewed FBOs report bu-
reaucracy as a main challenge for their 
effective work towards achieving quali-
ty education for all. Respondents claim 
that it takes too long for a request to be 
addressed by government authorities, 
consequently upsetting the smooth 
running of the FBO’s operations. 

“Sometimes we start operating day 

schools but when we want to expand 

our operations to include board-

ing structures, problems start…., 

the government takes too long to 

provide permission to do so. This is 

an obstacle for us to accomplish our 

purpose.” (TEC in Dar es Salaam)

Sometimes the government imposes 
directives which, according to re-
sponding FBOs, lead to negative 
impacts. For instance, the government 
recently directed private schools not to 
dismiss students who are performing 
poorly. FBOs indicated that this may 
lead to their schools performing poorly.

Inadequate funding for FBOs’ 
education programs is found to be an-
other impediment for progress towards 
achieving SDG 4 – Quality Education. 
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4.3 Contribution to 
SDG 5 (Gender Equality)

Different FBOs have different ap-
proaches in dealing with gender 
inequalities within their setting, under 
the guidance of their faith scriptures, 
the Bible and the Quran. However, 
Tanzania recognizes that gender in-
equality is a major obstacle to socio-
economic and political development. 
Many studies have shown that gender 
inequality is one of the underlying 
causes of low productivity as it, among 
other things, hampers the participa-
tion of at least half of the country’s 
population.

In recognition of this fact, the 
government of Tanzania has taken 
measures to ensure equality of all 
its citizens and, in particular, gender 
equality and gender equity. FBOs are 

in the forefront in ensuring equality 
within communities and within their or-
ganizations by establishing dedicated 
desks to deal with gender development 
with a focus on overcoming discrimina-
tion of women and girls. 

The ministry responsible for gen-
der and children, among other things, 
facilitates policies and guidelines on 
women and gender development 
aiming at mainstreaming a gender 
perspective into all policies, programs 
and strategies. Some FBOs are actively 
including gender policies and guide-
lines within their religious operations. 
However, some recently adopted poli-
cies seem to undermine these efforts. 
For example, the government’s deci-
sion to disallow girls who fall pregnant 
to continue with their education in 
public schools is considered by civil 
society as an obstacle to giving such 
vulnerable girls a second chance in life. 

FBOs in Tanzania actively promote 
gender equality and empowerment of 
women and girls in various ways. Their 
contributions range from economic 
empowerment to political empower-
ment, advocacy for gender rights and 
women’s education, to the application 
of gender policies within their own 
organizations and institutions.

BAKWATA
BAKWATA promotes and provides 

equal employment opportunities for 
women and men. Moreover, through 
several projects, it raises awareness 
on issues of gender equality in com-
munities to create self-awareness. 
BAKWATA also provides women entre-
preneurs with free training. Within its 
Islamic education, BAKWATA teaches 
about the rights of children (including 
girls) and women.

CCT
CCT promotes and provides em-

ployment opportunities for women and 
men equally. It also works to promote 
women economic empowerment 
by providing education on women 

SDG 5 
Achieve gender 
equality and empower 
all women and girls

Target

FBA

BAKWATA

CCT

CSSC

ELCT

NCA

TCRS

TEC



entrepreneurship and self-awareness, 
describing their rights and assisting 
them when they experience problems 
in their families. A project within CCT 
Dodoma demonstrates this through 
helping women and mothers to ad-
vertise their business products and to 
search for markets. CCT moreover has 
a project which works to encourage and 
empower women to vie for political po-
sitions at local and national level. They 
encourage women to contest for inter-
nal leadership positions and proactively 
involve women and girls in meetings, so 
as to build up their capacities.

The Moravian and Anglican church-
es, which are members of CCT, are 
particularly active and advocate for 
gender rights, give women education 
and skills so that they can own prop-
erty. They also help them in managing 
crisis situations and conflict mitiga-
tions relating to or caused by gender 
inequalities within communities. 

CSSC
CSSC being an advocacy body 

particularly in health and education, 
encourages women to apply for job 
opportunities and give them priority in 
recruitment. It also has a gender policy 
for fairness in the office and against 
domination by any sex. 

ELCT
ELCT Arusha implements gender 

justice programs such as ELCT Gender 
Justice Program 2018-2020 which has 
the aim of correcting gender imbalanc-
es in the society. ELCT has succeeded 
to increase the number of female mem-
bers in its general assembly up to 26% 
in 2019. ELCT moreover runs programs 
to enhance self-awareness and educa-
tion on the rights of women and girls, 
with the aim of improving women’s in-
dependence. ELCT conducts seminars 
that teach gender issues and provides 
education for girls.

Within ELCT, women are provided 
opportunities to participate as repre-
sentatives in decision-making boards 
and meetings. As an example, ELCT 
in Kilimanjaro region has succeeded 
in having a large number of women 
who are pastors. Recently, ELCT 
has launched its own gender policy 
document which will guide all gender 
related work in ELCT congregations 
and dioceses in the country. 

NCA
NCA works to ensure that its proj-

ects are gender sensitive and prepares 
reports with gender sensitivity, focusing 
on the projects and beneficiaries. Fur-
thermore, NCA provides training to its 
partners on gender equality and gender 
justice. NCA makes use of paralegal 
service providers to mainstream gender 
in existing projects such as the WASH 
program which cares for reproductive 
health in schools and ensures that all 
children, including girls, can access 
their rights. NCA supports Haydom 
Hospital which gives women priority. 
In addition, NCA supports a project on 
economic empowerment with empha-
sis for young women and mothers.

TEC
TEC encourages mothers and wom-

en to participate in decision-making 
processes, own assets, distribute work 
equitably within the family, and raise chil-
dren equally. It also formulates policies, 
distributes the policies and guidelines, 
and takes initiative to educate followers 
so that they can recognize the position 
of girls and women in society. Increas-
ingly, TEC provides education on gender 
issues. Furthermore, TEC runs a project 
focusing on economic empowerment of 
women as well as provision of psychoso-
cial support. In addition, TEC has gender 
desks in all its dioceses with full-time 
staff to support the day-to-day opera-
tions of gender-related issues.

TCRS
TCRS in its area of intervention cre-

ates awareness to men and women on 
gender justice and equality, changing 
their mind set and including women in 
all interventions in all stages as equal 
members of society, empowering them 
through their inclusion in capacity 
building, formation of groups, VICO-
BAs and income-generating activities 
(IGAs), to generate income and to have 
control over the generated benefits. 
Gender-based violence (GBV) is ad-
dressed and considered as unaccept-
able in the community and women are 
supported to claim their rights. TCRS 
utilizes the VICOBA platform and IGAs 
to challenge taboos and practices that 
are discriminatory to women and girls. 
TCRS also trains cultural and religious 
leaders on GBV and engages them in 
advocating for gender justice and in 
the fight against GBV. 

TCRS provides education for wom-
en and men. There are special em-
powerment classes, offering political 
and economic education for women. 
TCRS also offers education on sexual 
and reproductive health and rights in 
primary and secondary schools.

TARGET 5.1: End 
all forms of dis-
crimination against 
all women and girls 
everywhere.

TARGET 5.2: Elimi-
nating all forms of 
violence against all 
women and girls in 
the public and pri-
vate spheres, includ-
ing trafficking and 
sexual and other 
types of exploitation.

Both Christian and Muslim organiza-
tions promote gender equality and 
justice as part of their day-to-day 
preaching and interaction with their 
members. They also include gender 
topics as part of their formal and in-
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formal education work and awareness 
raising at community level. Women’s 
meetings that form part of the regular 
church life are used to monitor gender 
equality and bring up concerns.

A number of FBOs stand out as 
strong advocates against all forms 
of abuse, violence and harassment 
against women and girls. A few FBOs, 
such as the ELCT, have specific desks 
for Advocacy and/or Women. Most 
of the interviewed FBOs report that 
they encourage and support victims 
in reporting cases to the authorities, 
offer counselling and/or psychoso-
cial assistance. For instance, CCT 
and its member churches advocate 
specifically for the abolition of wife 
inheritance, widow re-marriages and 
harmful traditional practices, which 
continue to be practiced in some parts 
of the Tanzanian society. An example 
is a program through which legal aid 
through paralegals is provided to those 
concerned. ELCT provides legal and 
psychosocial support to girls who are 
victims of rape, abuse or oppression 
or who have experienced any form of 
discrimination. Those who have been 
abused are brought to church for legal 
support services, education and train-
ing. In Mwanza region, ELCT organizes 
meetings and social dialogues with 
lawyers, psychologists and pastors 
who educate people about sexual 
abuse and its effects. 

Political, economic and social em-
powerment programs for women are 
one way in which FBOs contribute to 
reducing discrimination and violence 
against women and girls. One example 
is NCA, which through her local part-
ners supports up to 2,795 women 
and girls in 13 districts of Tanzania to 
engage in vegetable farming. It thereby 
enhances women’s independence 
from men in their economic livelihoods.

Several FBOs have adopted gender 
and/or child protection policies. For 
instance, the child protection policy 
of CSSC plays an important role in 

the organization’s coordination role 
for health and education projects. 
Enforcement mechanisms include a 
disciplinary committee and a sugges-
tion box where staff can submit any 
complaints related to sexual harass-
ment. ELCT has adopted a gender 
justice policy. 

Some of the interviewed FBOs 
underline their effort to mainstream 
gender considerations into all of their 
operations and programs. This is for 
instance the case of NCA, which 
advises all partner organizations to 
integrate a gender perspective into 
their project planning.

TARGET 5.3: Elimi-
nating all harmful 
practices, such as 
child, early and 
forced marriage 
and female genital 
mutilation.

Christian and Muslim FBOs stand up 
against harmful practices, including 
early and forced marriage and female 
genital mutilation. They educate 
and raise awareness on the nega-
tive consequences of such practices 
through dedicated community-based 
programs and preaching. For instance, 
TEC supports the formation of youth 
clubs at its schools, with the aim of 
sensitization and reducing child mar-
riage. It provides both physical and 
spiritual education on the rights of 
children, consequences of child mar-
riage, and encourages girls to report 
any abuse. Various girls’ empowerment 
programs are implemented by FBOs 
as a means of preventing harmful 
traditional practices.

FBOs support victims of harmful 
traditional practices by providing safe 
homes, counselling, teaching them 
life skills and assisting them in obtain-
ing legal aid. Some FBOs carry out 
or participate in specific campaigns, 
such as “The Child of Africa” in the 
case of ELCT.

TARGET 5.5: 
Ensuring women’s 
full and effective 
participation and 
equal opportunities 
for leadership at all 
levels of decision-
making in politi-
cal, economic and 
public life.

FBOs encourage women and the com-
munity generally to understand their 
rights and the importance of participat-
ing in leadership positions in society 
and building confidence to contest for 
political positions. Some of the respond-
ing FBOs, such as CCT and TEC, report 
that they conduct specific education 
and capacity building for women, in 
order to motivate them to participate 
in elections for leadership positions. 
The main objective is to ensure women 
participate effectively and have equal 
leadership positions at all levels of deci-
sion-making in politics, economics, and 
in the community. ELCT uses special 
days for women, such as International 
Women’s Day and Menstruation Day, 
for the same purpose.

TARGET 5.6: 
Ensuring girls’ and 
women universal 
access to sexual 
and reproductive 
health and repro-
ductive rights.

FBOs in Tanzania promote access to 
sexual and reproductive health care 
and reproductive rights in various ways. 
Some of the FBOs limit their activity 
to raising general awareness of these 
rights and existing services and to 
encouraging women and girls to make 
use of them. Others, such as CCT 
and ELCT, through their health and 
education institutions, run dedicated 
programs on sexual and reproductive 
health as well as reproductive rights, 
offering related services either directly 
or in cooperation with specialists in 
the field. 
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TARGET 5.A: Un-
dertaking reforms to 
give women equal 
rights to economic 
resources, as well 
as access to owner-
ship and control 
over land and other 
forms of property, 
financial services, 
inheritance and 
natural resources.

FBOs’ focus in relation to this target 
is mainly on providing awareness and 
education about women’s rights to own 
and inherit resources and property, in-
cluding productive assets. CCT focuses 
on educating parents to realize that all 
children are equal and that all children 
should be allocated equal rights to own 
property, as well as providing entrepre-
neurial education to promote income 
generation, and land rights.

ELCT reviews policies that prohibit 
women from owning resources such 
as land. In addition, ELCT has started 
to organize women within women’s 
groups such as Village Community 
Banks (VICOBA) and the Savings and 
Credit Co-Operative Society (SACCOS), 
which help women gain financial inde-
pendence by owning and managing 
their own financial assets.

TARGET 5.B: 
Enhancing use of 
enabling technol-
ogy, in particular 
information and 
communications 
technology, to 
promote women 
empowerment.

FBOs increasingly make use of mod-
ern information and communication 
technology to reach out to their mem-
bers and communicate on various top-
ics, including women’s empowerment. 
Some FBOs proactively encourage 

women to own and make use of smart 
phones, the internet and social media 
to get access to information of interest 
and relevance to them. 

Some FBOs recognize that the 
introduction of those technologies is 
an ongoing process, which will need 
further investment and dedication in 
the future. 

TARGET 5.C: Adopt-
ing sound policies 
and enforceable 
legislation for 
the promotion of 
gender equality and 
empowerment of all 
women and girls at 
all levels.

Some FBOs, for instance BAKWATA, 
contribute to enhancing knowledge of 
existing national policies and laws that 
regulate gender equality. Others, such 
as ELCT, in collaboration with other 
Civil Society Organizations (CSOs), ac-
tively advocate for strengthening those 
policies and better enforcing existing 
rights of women and girls through le-
gal duty bearers. ELCT is also among 
those FBOs that have adopted their 
own gender policy document. The 
ELCT’s gender policy document de-
fines its internal commitment to gender 
equality and justice and to guiding 
gender-related advocacy and outreach 
in congregations and dioceses.

SDG 5 Implementation 
Challenges 

Low community awareness and 
prevalence of gender stereotypes

In many cases, community mem-
bers are influenced by their tradi-
tions and religions and still have 

limited awareness of gender and 
human rights. In Tanzanian society, 
there are still many cultural practices, 
traditions and taboos that hinder the 
elimination of gender-based violence 
in some areas. These, coupled with 
some religious teachings, make it 
a big challenge to promote change. 
Moreover, the demand for community 
gender education offered by FBAs is 
greater than the capacity of religious 
institutions.

Gender-based stereotypes are 
still strongly present in large parts of 
Tanzanian society and people resist 
changing their culture. This makes the 
work of FBOs challenging, e.g. when 
it comes to educating the community 
about the importance of including 
women at all levels of leadership. 

At times, people are confused by 
the different teachings and guidance 
they receive from the state, religious 
education, and traditions.

Existence of conflicting laws
There are still contradictory laws 

when it comes to the promotion of gen-
der equality in the country. For instance, 
the Marriage Act allows a girl aged 14 
years to be married, while the Law of 
the Child Act protects her since she is 
still a child. Certain laws of inheritance 
and property management for women 
and girls are equally contested. 
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4.4 SDG 10 (Reduced 
Inequalities)

Tanzania is a developing country in 
which inequalities between individuals 
remain strong. Poverty rates are high, 
especially in rural areas, due to uneven 
distribution of economic gains and long-
term historical trends. This is despite 
the fact that economic reforms have 
been undertaken and public and private 
investments in social sectors, such as 
education and health, have increased. 

FBOs in Tanzania have engaged 
in advocating against economic in-
equalities. An example has been the 
advocacy of FBOs in favor of debt relief 
for developing countries like Tanzania. 
Until today, the majority of FBOs 
continues preaching and advocating 
for fairness and reducing the gap 
between rich and poor communities 
in the same country.

BAKWATA
BAKWATA motivates people in the 

community to work hard so that they 
can improve their living standards. Fur-
thermore, BAKWATA supports women’s 
economic empowerment groups.

CCT
CCT supports community-based 

financial groups, such as VICOBA (Village 
Community Banks) and Savings and In-
ternal Lending Community (SILC) groups 
in order to enhance living conditions for 
those with low income. CCT collaborates 

3	 Nane Nane Day is a public holiday in Tanzania commemorated on 8 August each year to recognize the contribution of farmers to 

the national economy.

with the government to provide education 
to the community at all levels and sup-
ports members of small financial groups 
for participation in different occasions for 
learning such as Nane Nane Day.3

“…we are providing training to the 

community for the people to join VI-

COBA… We also support members 

of VICOBA to participate in different 

occasions for example nane nane 

day…” (CCT Shinyanga)

ELCT
ELCT supports financial groups such 

as SACCOS and VICOBA. It also encour-
ages more people to join those groups 
in order to get loans and start their own 
small businesses. ELCT provides life 
skills education and capacity building 
for income-generating activities.

“…. we encourage people to join 

financial groups such as VICOBA 

and SACCOS so that they can get 

loans and start different businesses. 

We also offer loans to women who 

have children with disabilities to help 

themselves and their children.… We 

offer loans not for the aim of getting 

profit but for improving life standards 

of people….” (ELCT Dodoma)

NCA
NCA supports its partners in imple-

menting an economic empowerment 
project, which trains beneficiaries and 
supports them to form VICOBA groups 
in several districts. NCA also operates 
a resource governance project, which 
supports beneficiaries in the effec-
tive use of financial resources while 
advocating for equal distribution of 
state dividends, particularly from the 
extractive industry. NCA is currently 
supporting the Make It Possible Cam-
paign, which seeks to redress effects 
of income inequality by advocating for 
progressive taxes and tax-funded social 
protection in order to ensure universal 
health coverage for all Tanzanians.

Target

FBO

BAKWATA

CCT

ELCT

NCA

TCRS

TEC

SDG 10 
Reduce inequality 
within and among 
countries
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TEC
TEC collaborates with the govern-

ment to provide entrepreneurship edu-
cation. It also preaches about reducing 
inequalities. Moreover, it has VICOBA 
groups for improving the economic 
status mainly of women.

TARGET 10.1: 
Achieving and 
sustaining income 
growth for the poor.

Providing entrepreneurship education 
and supporting the establishment of 
small financial groups (such as VI-
COBA, SACCOS, and SILC) are activi-
ties that most of the interviewed FBOs 
implement to improve the economic 
situation and livelihood of low-income 
groups. The financial groups are used 
as platforms to teach women and men 
about value chain development, entre-
preneurship, and marketing.

“We are providing entrepreneurship 

skills……we support beneficiaries to 

establish small financial groups such 

as VICOBA, SACCOS and SILC for 

saving and giving loans to mem-

bers…” (BAKWATA Dar es Salaam)

“We provide training in agriculture to 

ensure availability of food…We pro-

vide seeds which can survive semi-

arid conditions.” (CCT Shinyanga)

FBOs moreover use preaching as an 
opportunity to motivate their members 
to work hard to improve their economic 
conditions. 

“We encourage people to engage 

in production activities in order to 

improve their economic status …. 

we also preach in church by using 

the word of God “Asiyefanya kazi na 

4	  Asiyefanya kazi na asile means “whoever doesn’t work should not get food.”

asile4” to influence people to work 

hard….” (ELCT Kilimanjaro)

TARGET 10.2: 
Empowering and 
promoting social, 
economic and politi-
cal inclusion of all, 
irrespective of age, 
sex, disability, race, 
ethnicity, origin, 
religion or economic 
or other status.

FBOs work towards inclusion and non-
discrimination when it comes to par-
ticipation within their own structures 
and activities. Moreover, several of 
them promote civil engagement, such 
as voting and standing for election, and 
some provide specific training on how 
to participate in the political sphere 
and compete for political positions. 

 “…. there is not any kind of discrimi-

nation ….in all groups discrimination 

has no space...” (BAKWATA Dodoma)

“We are providing training to our pro-

gram communities’ members on how 

to participate and compete in political 

positions” (TCRS, Dar es salaam)

TARGET 10.3: 
Ensuring equal op-
portunity and reduc-
ing inequalities of 
income.

Some of the larger FBOs in Tanzania 
employ a large number of people 
within their organizational structures 
and institutions (including schools and 
health facilities). Several of the inter-
viewed FBOs underline that all people 
are equally encouraged to apply for 
available employment opportunities 
they are providing. Employees are paid 
according to their level of education, 
accountability, and working experience.

Some FBOs, such as ELCT and 
TCRS, underline that they are promot-
ing equality at the family level, between 
men and women, when it comes to 
managing financial resources, land 
ownership, and sharing other family 
responsibilities.

SDG 10 Implementation 
Challenges 

Inadequate resources
Due to overwhelming poverty 

around the country, community needs 
are greater than the resources avail-
able in FBOs. There is a shortage of 
human resources. All FBOs are strug-
gling to finance their support to com-
munities and to provide community-
based education. Common challenges 
are the shortage of capital to support 
small community groups, low educa-
tion of community members, and high 
demand compared to the capacities 
available. Some FBOs try to address 
such challenges by entering into part-
nerships and building the capacity and 
knowledge of a few group members by 
having them attend relevant seminars. 

Communities are slow to change
Even with robust appeals and 

encouragement of poor community 
members to join VICOBA and SACCOS 
groups, and getting communities to ac-
cept to join hands in order to improve 
their economic situation, combatting 
inequalities remains a challenge. FBOs 
report that there is still a very low up-
take, particularly among men, to join 
such groups, even after being oriented 
on the benefits that can be expected. 
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4.5 SDG 16 (Peace, 
Justice and Strong 
Institutions)

Throughout history, FBOs in Tanzania 
have played a critical role in shaping 
political, economic, social, and cultural 
views and the opinions of many people. 
Faith has very much contributed to 
peace, tranquility, and harmonious 
co-existence in Tanzania. 

Given the recent involvement of 
FBOs in the deliberation of various po-
litical issues, some political leaders and 
commentators criticized the positioning 
of religious actors stating that those 
should remain apolitical. These critiques 
reflect the shrinking public space for 
FBOs as ruling authorities concentrate 
their executive powers and limit the 
scope for checks and balances. With 
these powers, executive controls have 
limited democratic processes such as 
political parties’ meetings, freedom of 
speech, freedom of assembly and free-
dom of information. This has oftentimes 
created tensions among the authorities, 
members of political parties and citizens. 
In addition, the independence of the 
national parliament and judiciary as 
self-governing entities is observed to be 
at stake with reducing political space.

At the same time, the Tanzanian 
constitution does not prohibit FBOs 
from participating in strengthening 
good governance nor in participating 
in the provision of civic education 
aimed at creating a united, peaceful, 

and democratic Tanzania. Article 21(2) 
of the constitution states that “Every 
citizen has the right and the freedom 
to participate fully in the process lead-
ing to the decision on matters affecting 
him, his well-being or the nation.”

BAKWATA
BAKWATA contributes to promoting 

just, peaceful and inclusive societies in 
Tanzania by preaching on justice and 
peacemaking in the mosques. BAK-
WATA participates in various forums 
at all levels that aim at strengthening 
justice, peace and inclusion. 

“Our religion preaches about peace 

as one of our duties in our daily ac-

tivities.” (BAKWATA, Arusha region)

ELCT
ELCT conducts programs which 

sensitize people about peace main-
tenance and conflict resolution. Usu-
ally, these programs are conducted in 
cooperation with other stakeholders 
such as Norwegian Church Aid and 
ACT Alliance. As a religious institution, 
preaching on justice and peace is the 
main task. Furthermore, ELCT runs 
centers which take care of disadvan-
taged groups to ensure that their basic 
rights are realized.

“We have centres for protecting and 

educating children who are living in 

difficult environments. This strength-

ens them physically, mentally and 

gives them peace of mind.” (ELCT 

Arusha)

CCT
CCT promotes just, peaceful and 

inclusive societies on a daily basis 
through preaching. CCT supports and 
collaborates with paralegal centers to 
assist the communities in their legal 
matters. Moreover, CCT is a strong 
participant in national interfaith col-
laborations and hosts a forum yearly 
to promote national peace.

NCA
NCA implements a number of 

projects, including community-based 
projects, which incorporate issues 
related to justice, peace, inclusion 
and accountable institutions. For more 
than ten years, NCA has supported 
Public Expenditure Tracking Systems 
(PETS) at the community level whereby 
citizens are trained to track the use of 
local public resources, expose when 
these are not used for their intended 
purpose and seek justice so these 
resources are recovered for the de-
velopmental purposes for which they 
were intended.

NCA has supported the formation 
of interfaith committees to ensure 
that NCA projects benefit the entire 
targeted population regardless of 
religious orientation. In addition, NCA 
supports and encourages religious 
leaders to preach about peace, justice 
and inclusion.

TEC
TEC has a management structure 

with a specific department that deals 
with matters related to justice and 
peace. In addition, TEC currently hosts 
the National Interfaith Body which co-
ordinates all faiths in working together 

SDG 16  
Promote peaceful and 
inclusive societies 
for sustainable 
development, provide 
access to justice for 
all and build effective, 
accountable and 
inclusive institutions 
at all levels



28	 The Lutheran World Federation

to promote peace, justice and democ-
racy in the country. As well, TEC trains 
diocesan justice and peace workers.

SDG 16 Targets

TARGET 16.1: Re-
ducing all forms of 
violence and related 
deaths.

FBOs contribute significantly to reduc-
ing all forms of violence and related 
deaths through their daily activities and 
ongoing programs all over the country.

Preaching about non-violence 
to their followers is one of the main 
forms of FBOs’ contributions in this 
area. Scriptures are used to condemn 
all forms of violence in the community 
and to urge people to love one another. 
Some FBOs (such as ELCT) make 
use of the media to disseminate their 
preaching against community violence 
to a large audience.

Next to preaching, FBOs use their 
education institutions and dedicated 
programs to carry the message of 
peace, non-violence and accountability. 

FBOs protect vulnerable population 
groups from violence, e.g. orphans, as 
is the case for CCT member churches. 
They also assist and support victims 
of violence and report cases to the 
relevant authorities. 

“We teach people about human dig-

nity, we educate each other during 

funerals, peace sessions and we re-

port violence incidents.” (BAKWATA 

Kilimanjaro region)

“We take children from vulnerable 

environments and bring them to safe 

environments.” (CCT Iringa region) 

TARGET 16.2: End-
ing abuse, exploita-
tion, trafficking and 
all forms of violence 
against and torture 
of children.

Abuse, exploitation, trafficking and vio-
lence against children are addressed 
by FBOs through preaching. Various 
platforms and media channels are 
used by FBOs to carry their message 
to their members and the wider public. 

BAKWATA uses the media, ser-
mons, entrepreneurship seminars, 
schools, committees, and conferences 
to speak about abuse, exploitation, 
trafficking and all forms of violence 
against, and torture of, children. 

“We teach people by using sermons. 

We attend conferences and deliver 

speeches on peacemaking. Our peace 

committee collaborates with many 

legal entities to help end abuse, exploi-

tation, trafficking and all forms of vio-

lence against, and torture of, children.” 

(BAKWATA Shinyanga region) 

“We preach through radio programs 

using our radio station ‘Furaha radio’ 

to encourage our people to be pio-

neers for child protection and help-

ing the poor.” (ELCT Iringa region) 

Community-based programs are used 
to raise awareness about all forms of 
violence, in some cases with a focus 
on violence against children. Victims 
are supported in referring their cases 
to the state authorities. 

“We teach people to end abuse, exploi-

tation, trafficking and all forms of vio-

lence against, and torture of, children 

that is not right to humanity as it is said 

in the scriptures.” (CCT Iringa region)

“We collaborate with CARITAS (a 

Catholic organization) to provide 

education on ending violence. …we 

also refer victims of violence to the 

police gender and children desk.” 

(CCT Mbeya region)

“We have a special program for 

educating children not to join bad 

peer groups that could expose them 

to risks… We have been conduct-

ing seminars to create community 

awareness on the consequences of 

violence and torture to children. For 

instance, in July 2018 we conducted 

a seminar to teach people on child 

trafficking. About 800 children par-

ticipated.” (TEC Singida region)

Target

FBO

BAKWATA 

CCT

ELCT

TEC
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TARGET 16.5: 
Reducing corruption 
and bribery in all 
their forms.

Christian and Muslim FBOs alike preach 
and teach against corruption and bribery 
and collaborate with the government 
in the fight against corruption, e.g. by 
bringing corrupt individuals to court.

“We preach against corruption in the 

mosques in support of our government 

under President Magufuli who is lead-

ing the fight against corruption and 

bribery.” (BAKWATA Arusha region)

“Corruption is part of our sermons to 

our community because we know it 

is an enemy of justice. They are not 

to accept giving or receiving bribes. 

The community is supposed to 

notice that, and it is our responsibil-

ity to tell them to refrain from corrupt 

behaviors.” (CCT Iringa region)

“Every month we collaborate with the 

national anti-corruption agency to reach 

people with education on corruption 

and bribery in all forms…. we use 

sermons and teachings at all levels from 

regional, district and village level to drive 

corruption out so that someday it will 

come to an end.” (TEC Mbeya region)

ELCT emphasizes its significant com-
mitment in this area by having their own 
anti-corruption policy. Whoever goes 
against the policy is subjected to strict 
punishment. ELCT sees bribery as some-
thing that devalues the person’s integrity.

TARGET 16.6: 
Developing effective, 
accountable and 
transparent institu-
tions at all levels.

FBOs are particularly active in the 
country in supporting the development 

of effective, accountable and transpar-
ent institutions at all levels – both with-
in public institutions and particularly 
within their own structures. Several of 
the interviewed FBOs underline that 
they have strict internal policies and 
guidelines for effectiveness, account-
ability and transparency within their 
institutions and programs, including 
all financial operations. Staff is trained 
and instructed accordingly.

“We do capacity building of our staff 

from lower to higher level to ensure 

everyone knows everything: nothing is 

hidden….” (BAKWATA Arusha region)

Some of the responding FBOs under-
line their processes for inclusive deci-
sion making, especially when it comes 
to programs providing services to the 
communities. 

“In our region we have a transparent 

decision-making strategy that involves 

children, youths and women to pro-

vide their views on matters touching 

their lives”. (ELCT Singida region)

“We stick to directives from the 

church headquarters on how to 

undertake our activities particularly 

on serving communities, protecting 

the rights of different priority groups 

such as elders.” (TEC Mbeya region)

TARGET 16.9: Pro-
viding legal identity 
for all, including 
birth registration.

FBOs make a significant contribution 
to this overall target. However, they are 
not directly involved in providing legal 
identity. They act as facilitators and help 
people make decisions on obtaining 
legal identities. FBOs, e.g. through their 
health facilities, are in a position to guide 
people on where and how to get legal 
identity, particularly birth registration. 

As well, FBOs provide education to the 
community on the importance of having 
legal identities and birth certificates.

TARGET 16.10: En-
suring public access 
to information, and 
protecting funda-
mental freedoms, 
in accordance with 
national legislation 
and international 
agreements.

FBOs undertake programs that either 
directly or indirectly increase public 
access to information. A number of 
FBOs, including BAKWATA, ELCT and 
TEC, own media channels, including 
newspapers, radios and TV stations 
that provide public access to informa-
tion. Social media channels are used 
for the same purpose. Related to that, 
FBOs often have dedicated communi-
cation desks/departments.

“We have media law that allows 

people to provide and get news. This 

law is found in the universal declara-

tion of rights of 1984… We also have 

our newspaper, and Radio Imani …” 

(BAKWATA Arusha region)

Some of the responding FBOs, such 
as CCT and ELCT, report that their pro-
grams include specific activities aimed at 
promoting and protecting fundamental 
freedoms in accordance with national 
legislation and international agreements. 

TARGET 16.A: 
Strengthening 
relevant national in-
stitutions, including 
through internation-
al cooperation, for 
building capacity at 
all levels, to prevent 
violence and combat 
terrorism and crime.

FBOs undertake programs that either 
directly or indirectly contribute to this tar-
get. For instance, BAKWATA conducts 
meetings to teach people about the dan-
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gers of terrorism and the prevention of 
violence. These meetings are conducted 
at different levels from village mosque 
level to national level and are conducted 
with various partners worldwide. BAK-
WATA uses scriptures from the holy 
Quran to tell people that terrorism and 
violence is against the will of God. 

“For example, in January 2019 our 

regional leaders got the chance of 

visiting Oman to learn how in this 

big Islamic country both Muslim 

and Christians live in peace but 

also through this trip, participants 

were able to learn how to fight and 

eliminate violence in communities.” 

(BAKWATA Shinyanga)

A number of Christian FBOs work in 
collaboration with the government and 
collaborate with partners from around 
the world to eliminate all forms of 
crime and violence, including terror-
ism. Preaching and teaching are used 
to inform followers about the risks and 
consequences of those dangerous acts 
and to promote responsible behavior. 

TARGET 16.B: 
Promoting and 
enforcing non-dis-
criminatory laws and 
policies for sustain-
able development.

FBOs are significant actors in promot-
ing and enforcing non-discriminatory 
laws and policies for sustainable de-
velopment in Tanzania. BAKWATA and 
ELCT are among the institutions that 
report that they conduct targeted advo-
cacy and collaborate with government 
and other stakeholders to promote and 
enforce such laws and policies. 

SDG 16 Implementation 
Challenges 

Poor response from 
the community

In the course of implementing differ-
ent activities, FBOs expect communities 
to respond positively so as to reach the 
intended goals. Unfortunately, in some 
cases community response is very low. 
For instance, BAKWATA in Kilimanjaro 
region reports that when people from 
the community are called to attend 
events that aim at enhancing justice and 
peace, response is poor, particularly for 
youth. Apart from that, communities fail 
to report perpetrators to the authorities. 
As a result, violence and other unjust 
acts persist in the community. 

“One of the challenges is failure of 

members of the community to report 

perpetrators of violence.” (ELCT 

Singida region)

Shortage of facilities to 
support FBOs’ activities

Shortage of facilities and equipment 
to support their activities hinders FBOs 
from effectively contributing to SDG 16. 
For instance, in Shinyanga region there 
is an interfaith partnership between 
Christians and Muslims. Most of the 
time it fails to conduct meetings because 
most members are not comfortable with 
attending a meeting at someone else’s 
compound. Since there is no “common 
ground” meeting/conference facility, 
they end up postponing meetings that 
could be important for justice and peace 
in the region and the country as a whole. 

Shortage of funds to reach 
the wider community

FBOs mention the shortage of funds 
as a major challenge for their operations 

toward achieving SDG 16. The lack of 
sufficient funds restricts them from 
reaching many people in the community. 
Furthermore, some programs fail to start 
since there are not enough funds.

“There is a severe shortage of 

financial resources compared to the 

needs…. And as the days go donors 

disappear…This creates a difficult 

environment for implementation of 

our projects.” (CCT Iringa region)

Lack of awareness of 
existing laws and policies

This is a common challenge in many 
areas where FBOs operate. The major-
ity of people in the communities are un-
aware of existing laws and policies that 
protect and promote their rights. This 
gives FBOs a difficult time in bringing 
changes to these communities.

“One of the challenges that we face is 

poor understanding and awareness 

of existing laws and policies on rights 

and peace… We face difficulties 

because some people become resis-

tant.” (BAKWATA Singida region)

FBOs use sermons, training and 
seminars to address some of the above 
challenges. Through sermons, people 
are constantly taught about how to 
address violence in their community 
despite the existing culture and prevail-
ing perceptions.

As for the lack of funds, FBOs pro-
actively search for alternative sources. 
For instance, FBOs mobilize resources 
from their members by asking them to 
support their programs and to support 
the needy through both in-kind and 
financial contributions. Furthermore, 
FBOs solicit funds from the govern-
ment to support their activities and 
programs so as to reduce dependence 
on external donors. 
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5. WAYS OF ENGAGEMENT OF FBOs

Apart from the contributions that FBOs 
make to specific goals under the United 
Nations’ 2030 Agenda, the mapping 
exercise aimed to identify ways in which 
FBOs get involved in SDG-related plan-
ning and implementation processes at 
local and national levels, and to what 
extent their contributions are recog-
nized and documented. The exercise 
also served to identify the partnerships 
in which FBOs typically engage in order 
to strengthen their role in implementa-
tion and advocacy related to SDGs.

5.1 Participation in 
local, national and 
international forums, 
committees, meetings 
and conferences

Respondents were asked to what ex-
tent their FBO participates in local, na-
tional and international forums, com-
mittees, meetings, and conferences 
related to SDGs 3, 4, 5, 10 and 16. 
They were also requested to explain 
their FBO’s role in such gatherings.

All of the interviewed FBOs par-
ticipate in forums and meetings con-
ducted by various stakeholders. This 
includes forums organized and hosted 
by NGOs where FBOs are invited to 
participate. However, most of these fo-
rums are local and regional. FBOs also 
attend interfaith meetings to discuss 
plans and strategies for their programs. 
These include CCT and CSSC forums. 

The Land Justice for Sustainable 
Peace in Tanzania and the Peace 
and Justice Commission in Tanzania 
are two examples of forums through 
which FBOs promote just, peaceful 
and inclusive societies. 

FBOs participate in a variety of 
meetings from village to national level. 

FBOs are invited to attend Regional 
Consultative Committee meetings to 
discuss development programs and 
issues including, but not limited to, 
poverty eradication and other commu-
nity challenges such as gender-based 
violence.

BAKWATA
BAKWATA participates in national, 

regional and district events where they 
share information. Such events include 
International Women’s Day and the 
Day of the Africa Child. Their role is to 
educate the community and to encour-
age the public to recognize rights for 
women and men. They also provide 
education about child marriage, early 
marriage, and about ensuring that all 
children to get quality education.

CCT
CCT engages in meetings on policy 

making and participates in commemo-
rating International Woman’s day and 
World AIDS Day. Their responsibility 
is to educate the community as well 
as to discuss topics such as gender 
rights. CCT participates in national 
level conferences where they present 
their position, progress and challenges. 

“We participate as participants as well 

as facilitators.” (CCT Dodoma region)

ELCT
ELCT participates in several high-

level political and social forums world-
wide including the UN Commission on 
the Status of Women, the UN High-
level Political Forum on Sustainable 
Development, and the International 
Forum for Gender Equality with the 

aim of promoting social protection and 
social security for women and girls and 
enhancing gender justice. In addition, 
ELCT participates in national and re-
gional meetings where their role is to 
share views and opinions. The church 
is committed to work with interfaith 
partners in releasing prophetic state-
ments that aim to strengthen the unity 
of the nation.

NCA
NCA participates in forums against 

gender-based violence where they 
bring leaders together and promote 
awareness in the community about 
human rights. Their main goal is to 
educate the community. 

TEC
TEC participates in local, national 

and international conferences such 
as those organized by CARITAS and 
SHIKANET. Their main role is to mobilize 
communities around emerging chal-
lenges, as well as training the community 
on how to change society by identifying 
their problems and on how to find solu-
tions to these problems. In addition, TEC 
participates in the commemoration of 
International Women’s Day and in local 
government authorities meetings. Their 
roles are to share their opinions and 
views on development issues and to 
share their reports and plans. 

5.2 Engagement 
by government in 
planning, implementing 
and reporting

Respondents were asked about the 
extent to which their FBO is engaged 
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by local and central governments in 
planning, implementing and report-
ing on programs related to SDGs 3, 
4, 5, 10 and 16. They were further 
requested to state which types of data 
their FBO reports to the local and or 
central government, if any.

The study found that government 
has been involving FBOs to a large 
extent into the planning, implementing 
and reporting on programs at different 
levels. The emphasis is mostly on im-
plementation and reporting programs. 
CCT and ELCT indicated that they are 
invited to attend sessions of parliament 
as observers e.g. during the prepara-
tion of the development budget. FBOs 
implement a good number of programs 
in partnership with the government. 
Example include vaccination programs, 
programs for vulnerable children or for 
people living with HIV and AIDS. Where 
applicable, FBOs follow government 
guidelines for providing services. 

“We cooperate with government in many 

programs.” (TEC Shinyanga region)

“We have many programs implement-

ed in different wards and streets in 

partnership with the government.” 

(ELCT Mwanza region)

“We participate in different meetings 

with government education officers… 

we also participate in capacity building 

programs.” (BAKWATA Arusha region)

In addition to program implementa-
tion, FBOs frequently report different 
types of data and information to local 
and/or central governments. The data 
includes, but is not limited to, the ser-
vices provided by FBOs and theh num-
ber of people reached and/or served. 
Most of the reports are submitted on 
a monthly or quarterly basis.

“We send our reports to specific sec-

tors for them to know what we are 

doing.” (TEC Mbeya region)

5.3 Reporting and 
documenting FBOs’ 
work on SDGs

FBOs typically document and share 
their work through technical prog-
ress reports that are generated on 
monthly, quarterly, semi-annual and 
annual bases. Apart from sending 
their reports to the local and central 
government, they also keep copies 
to share with other stakeholders and 
for documentation purposes. Those 
reports inform their planning and 
implementation as well as policy mak-
ing. This form of documentation, while 
shared with relevant stakeholders, is 
usually not made available for public 
consumption. Few FBOs publish ex-
amples of their work in newspapers 
for wider reach.

Respondents were requested to 
give suggestions for developing a 
monitoring, evaluation, and learning 
framework which Tanzanian FBOs 
could use to document and report their 
contributions to specific SDGs. Most of 
the FBOs suggest the establishment of 
a single shared monitoring and evalu-
ation system for sharing FBOs’ work 
on specific SDGs, similar to some 
governmental systems in place. 

“There is a need of establishing a 

single shared M&E system for shar-

ing our information.” (ELCT Shin-

yanga region)

“There must be a system to provide 

reports for example in health and 

education for each sector to know 

its contributions, and how much was 

contributed.” (ELCT Arusha)

In addition, FBOs propose to build 
the capacity of their staff for writing 
reports and for documenting. This 
means having a system is not enough: 
the people who are responsible for 
preparing reports and data should be 
well equipped to do so, in order to en-

sure quality data and information are 
available about FBOs’ contributions in 
implementing SDGs in Tanzania. 

“More education should be provided 

on report writing and emphasis 

should be provided on tracking indi-

cators and during evaluation, there 

should be feedback on the perfor-

mance.” (TEC Singida region)

5.4 FBOs’ focus 
on vulnerable 
population groups

FBOs have a long track record in serv-
ing special population groups such 
as orphans and vulnerable children, 
women, girls, and youth. In Tanzania 
there are policies and strategic plans 
that place special population groups at 
the centre of program implementation. 
These policies demand stakeholders 
to engage and give priority to such 
groups. There are two key forms of 
engagement:

3.	FBOs directly provide services 
and support to special population 
groups. Almost all programs under-
taken by FBOs serve one or more 
of those special groups. 

4.	FBOs engage special populations 
in supporting program implemen-
tation. Many community-based 
programs implemented by FBOs 
engage special populations to en-
sure effective implementation. The 
special groups are engaged as peer 
support groups who help to reach 
others in the special groups. 

Below are some examples:

BAKWATA
BAKWATA supports and engages 

all special population groups by em-
powering them to solve their problems 
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in partnership with various local stake-
holders. It implements projects with 
people from all population groups to 
support them, based on availability of 
resources.

CCT
CCT organizes women and widows, 

gives them seminars and teaches 
them about their rights. CCT provides 
girls in youth clubs with education 
about child losses. In Mara, Dodoma, 
Singida and Manyara regions, with 
the close support of ACT Church of 
Sweden, it supports safe places for 
girls who have refused to be abducted 
or genitally mutilated.

ELCT
Within its work on gender equal-

ity, ELCT supports special population 
groups through training and preaching 
about lifestyles that promote gender 
equality, and through national cam-
paigns, where they provide adoles-
cents with sex education and informa-
tion about reproductive health. It also 
organizes sessions with adolescents 
and people with disabilities to listen 
to their challenges and provide advice.

NCA
NCA supports projects for the 

most vulnerable children. Examples 
of projects supported by NCA in-
clude Ilula orphanage in Iringa region 
and Four Corners Cultural Program 
(4CCP) which deals with orphans and 
neglected groups. 

TEC
TEC has a Department of Children 

and Youth which provides general edu-
cation and life-skills training to special 
population groups. TEC encourages 
women to form and register small 
self-support groups. They also provide 
technical education at technical col-
leges and give education and life-skills 
training to become independent. TEC 
gives those groups seed money for 
income generation activities to meet 
their basic needs.

5.5 Collaboration 
among Tanzanian FBOs

Respondents were asked to describe 
any networks and initiatives which 
are jointly implemented by Tanzanian 
FBOs. At the country level, various 
types of interfaith networks, linkages 
and joint initiatives exist that are used 
by FBOs as platforms to strengthen 

their operations. These networks play 
a role in addressing different issues 
facing FBOs and in sharing expertise. 
They form a strong voice for advocacy 
and sometimes represent the interests 
of the FBOs with the government. 

Responding FBOs indicate four 
networks namely CCT, CSSC, Compas-
sion and Tanzania Interfaith Partner-
ship (TIP). These networks involve 
different FBAs and serve different 
purposes. CCT and CSSC have been 
introduced earlier in this report (see 
section 3.2). TIP is a joint initiative of 
major faith-based actors in the country, 
including CCT, TEC, BAKWATA, the 
Mufti of Zanzibar office, and NCA. 
The role of TIP is to coordinate the 
implementation of joint projects and 
provision of legal support. Compassion 
International Tanzania is an Evangelical 
Christian holistic child development 
ministry dedicated to the needy 
children of Tanzania. Compassion’s 
sponsorship programs help to release 
children from spiritual, economic, so-
cial and physical poverty, with a view to 
enabling them to become responsible 
and fulfilled Christian adults

Apart from these established net-
works, there are various collaborations 
among FBOs on specific projects or 
processes. One example is the col-
laboration by BAKWATA, CCT and TEC 
on HIV and AIDS. 
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6. CONCLUSION

The findings of the mapping exer-
cise make it clear that FBOs are key 
partners for the government and UN 
when it comes to making progress 
towards SDGs 3, 4, 5, 10 and 16 in 
Tanzania. FBOs in Tanzania can build 
on longstanding experience in provid-
ing social services, raising awareness, 
and advocating for societal, economic 
and political concerns. Their activity 
reaches large populations throughout 
the country, including in remote areas. 
FBOs are uniquely positioned when it 
comes to working with communities 
and vulnerable population groups as 
they have the potential to change peo-
ple’s behavior and attitudes, taking their 
faith and traditions as a starting point. 
The FBOs that were interviewed during 
the mapping exercise repeatedly stated 
that preaching is used as an entry point 
to raise awareness on various societal 
issues, including sensitive topics. 

The interviewed FBOs, whether 
Christian or Muslim, show many 
similarities in their general engagement 
with the SDGs. They typically engage 
with a variety of different topics and 
cover a large spectrum of SDG targets 

with various activities, however, usually 
without framing their engagement in 
terms of “working on SDGs”. Based 
on the history of each FBO, but also 
their self-understanding and individual 
mission, FBOs have developed dif-
ferent emphases or “specializations” 
in their work with, and for, society. 
Only in a few cases are differences in 
approaches based on different faith 
convictions, e.g. when it comes to 
sexual and reproductive health rights. 
The commitment to serve the most 
vulnerable and needy and “leave no 
one behind” is common to all FBOs.

Collaboration between FBOs and 
government is very common and 
seen as positive and productive in 
most cases. However, several FBOs 
said that at the same time they see 
potential for strengthening these 
relationships. Partnership with UN 
agencies is much less common at this 
point and it seems that the UN is yet 
to discover FBOs as a key partner in 
pursuing the 2020 Agenda in Tanzania. 
FBOs also acknowledge that there is 
room for strengthening collaboration 
and coordination among faith actors, 

including both intra- and inter-faith 
partnerships. 

Awareness of, and alignment with, 
SDGs is still not very common among 
FBOs in Tanzania. The availability of 
quantitative data in relation to spe-
cific SDG targets and indicators is low. 
FBOs identified a need to build capac-
ity for high-quality data collection and 
documentation of their contributions 
to the SDGs. 

Financial limitations and limited 
capacities as compared to the huge 
developmental needs and demands 
that exist in Tanzanian society are 
some of the main challenges faced 
by FBOs in their work. To some ex-
tent, it might be possible to address 
some resource gaps through more 
intentional partnerships by exploiting 
synergies more effectively. Recogni-
tion by the government and UN of the 
key importance that FBOs have in 
achieving progress towards the SDGs 
will be a pre-condition to this. There is 
a need to consistently involve FBOs in 
implementation, but also in planning 
the national and local development 
agenda in Tanzania. 







“There are places where churches and 
other religious institutions are the only 

supporting and trusted actors in society.” 
(Act Church of Sweden, August 2019)


